















































Description

Position

Milestone

WIP_Date

Hours

II[)\A/_]JI

Value

Narration

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Assets

24/05/2022

0.80

$524.00

reviewed correspondence relating to costs assessments regarding claim against Hall
Chadwick/reviewed resnonse to same/provide instructions to our solicitors

BR

Clark Jarrold

Partner

Assets

27/04/2022

0.40

$260.00

Consider and then discuss query from David Whyte with Craig re use of hindsight in
assessina impairment of loans etc

BR

Charles Haines

Director

Assets

4/11/2021

0.20

$108.00

Review solicitors email, meet staff regarding preparation of investor list by court
mandated due date

BR

Charles Haines

Director

Assets

5/09/2022

0.10

$55.50

Ph call appointee regarding update in preparation for meeting

BR

Charles Haines

Director

Assets

8/02/2023

0.10

$55.50

Update regarding COI approval of settlement offer and judicial advice status, planning for
finalisation

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

20/09/2021

0.40

$136.00

Download the meeting minutes in the last 12 months for Equititrust Limited to provide to
David for review in relation to the liquidators claim against the fund for remuneration and

avnancec

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

27/09/2021

0.40

$136.00

Prepare email to our solicitors to draft an affidavit for responses to the notice to
members.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

22/11/2021

1.20

$408.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim reaardina the liauidators claim for remineration and exynensesg

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

23/11/2021

0.70

$238.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim raaardina thae linuidatare claim far remiinaratinn and avnancac

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

23/11/2021

$510.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim reaardina the liauidators claim for remuneration and exynensesg

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

24/11/2021

0.80

$272.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim raaardina thae linuidatare claim far remiinaratinn and avnancac

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

25/11/2021

0.30

$102.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim reaardina the liauidators claim for remineration and exynensesg

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

25/11/2021

1.20

$408.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim raaardina thae linuidatare claim far remiinaratinn and avnancac

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

25/11/2021

0.90

$306.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim reaardina the liauidatore claim for remuneration and exynensesg

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

25/11/2021

$170.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim raaardina thae linuidatare claim far remiinaratinn and avnancac

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

25/11/2021

$204.00

Locate and review information regarding management fees, interest distributions and
assets of the Fund for FY2010 and FY2011 to provide to our solicitors for the points of

claim reaardina the liauidatore claim for remuneration and exynensesg

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

3/12/2021

$170.00

Locate the EPF constitution to provide to our solicitors for the liquidators claim for
remuneration and exnenses

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

7/11/2022

$390.00

Locate and review documents relating to an assigned loan in order to provide support for
removal of a PPSR reaistration

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

7/11/2022

$429.00

Locate and review documents relating to an assigned loan in order to provide support for
removal of a PPSR reaistration

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

8/11/2022

0.70

$273.00

Locate and review documents relating to an assigned loan in order to provide support for
removal of a PPSR reaistration

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

14/11/2022

0.80

$312.00

Review email from the liquidators regarding PPSR registrations over creditors. Locate and

review documentation to determine the status of the loans and whether the PPSR
ranictratinn can ha remaved Advice David findinac

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Assets

16/11/2022

0.40

$156.00

Review email from the liquidators regarding PPSR registrations over creditors. Locate and
review documentation to determine the status of the loans and whether the PPSR
reaictration can he removed Advice David findinac
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BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Assets 16/11/2022 1.10 $429.00|Review email from the liquidators regarding PPSR registrations over creditors. Locate and
review documentation to determine the status of the loans and whether the PPSR
ranictratinn can ha remaved Advice David findinac

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Assets 16/11/2022 1.40 $546.00[Review email from the liquidators regarding PPSR registrations over creditors. Locate and
review documentation to determine the status of the loans and whether the PPSR
reaictration can he removed Advice David findinac

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Assets 3/08/2022 0.10 $29.50|Phone call from Shermarian Resort Cabarita Pty Lt caveator's consent for leases.

BR Moira Hattingh Professional Services |Assets 1/09/2022 0.40 $46.00(Filing

Support
BR Moira Hattingh Professional Services |Assets 27/04/2023 0.30 $34.50(Filing
Support

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 23/09/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed correspondence from two investors regarding winding up of the fund/court
aonplication reaarding finalisation/reviewed/amended responses

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 28/09/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed court application filed and served by EL's liquidators regarding claims against
the Fund's assets

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 5/10/2021 0.10 $63.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding court hearing in respect of
indemnitv claims/reviewed draft order

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 12/10/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators
application/reviewed draft letter to EL liquidators solicitors/provided instructions
renardina came

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 14/10/2021 1.30 $825.50(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
claim/reviewed affidavit of liquidators solicitors/orders made at hearing on 1 October

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 22/10/2021 1.50 $952.50|reviewed EL liquidators points of claim/email our solicitors regarding response/issues to
be raised

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 27/10/2021 1.60 $1,016.00|reviewed EL liquidators Points of Claim/reviewed 2011 accounts/reviewed constitution in
relation to manaaer's riahts to management fee and expenses

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 3/11/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding
response to our solicitors letter/reasons why they won't provide information in support of
their indemnity application/draft orders for hearing tomorrow/sent response

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 4/11/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
claim/application/draft orders for substituted service

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 4/11/2021 0.10 $63.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity claim and
outcome of court hearing/reviewed draft orders/forward to RW to prepare listing of
invactnre

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 15/11/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
application/draft letter to EL liquidators solicitors regarding particulars overdue and
aueries in reenect of naints of claim/nrovided inctriictiong

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 19/11/2021 0.50 $317.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
claim/reviewed particulars provided in support of points of claim/email our solicitors
renardina came

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 24/11/2021 0.50 $317.50(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators Points of
Claim/reviewed Points of Claim/reviewed management accounts/sent resnonse

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 26/11/2021 0.10 $63.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators Points of
Claim/timing of response to same/reviewed draft letter to EL liquidators
colicitore/nrovided inctriictione reaardinag came

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 26/11/2021 0.90 $571.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding two queries relating to EL
Liquidators Points of Claim/reviewed Constitution/reviewed reports to members/reviewed
racainte and navmentc/raviewad accaiinte/cant racnnnce

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 3/12/2021 2.60 $1,651.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
claim/reviewed Points of Claim/reviewed draft response/provided comments in respect of
came

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 3/12/2021 0.80 $508.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators Points of

Claim/reviewed draft replv/provided comments and instructions to finalise same




BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

6/12/2021

0.60

$381.00

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
application/reviewed updated reply to Points of Defence/reviewed draft letter to EL
liquidators solicitors regarding proposed way forward/reviewed draft court orders

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

7/12/2021

1.20

$762.00

reviewed counsels submissions in relation to directions hearing for EL liquidators
indemnity claims/reviewed claim relating to proof of debt process including timesheets

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

8/12/2021

0.20

$127.00

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding

hearing for indemnity application/reviewed proposed orders/provided instructions
reaardina same

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

8/12/2021

$63.50

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding court hearing for EL liquidators
indemnitv application/provided instructions reaarding same

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

9/12/2021

0.20

$127.00

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding

indemnity application/reviewed draft letter and draft order in response/provided
inctriictinne reaardina came

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

17/12/2021

0.30

$190.50

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding

indemnity and separate question applications/reviewed draft court orders and supporting
affidavit

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

13/01/2022

2.20

$1,441.00

reviewed correspondence from the EL liquidators solicitors and our solicitors regarding

indemnity application/reviewed decisions relied on by the liquidators/reviewed draft
lattar tn El linnidatare enlicitare/nravidad inctriictinne

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

28/01/2022

1.10

$720.50

reviewed affidavit filed and served in respect of EL liquidators application

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

16/02/2022

1.60

$1,048.00

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity

claim/reviewed EL liquidators outline of argument/compared to previous positions/email
anr colicitors reaardinag came

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

16/02/2022

0.30

$196.50

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and Hall Chadwick's solicitors regarding
indemnitv application/reviewed affidavit

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.30

$196.50

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
claim/reviewed draft letter to EL liquidators solicitors/application in respect of same

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

23/02/2022

$720.50

reviewed counsels submissions in respect of EL liquidators indemnity application/provided
instriictions in resnect of same

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

23/02/2022

$65.50

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity

application/reviewed draft email regarding settlement of EL proceedings/provided
inctriictione reaardinag came

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

24/02/2022

0.40

$262.00

reviewed final draft of counsels submissions regarding EL liquidators indemnity
anplication/provided instructions reaardina same

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

24/02/2022

0.90

$589.50

reviewed updated counsels submissions regarding EL liquidators indemnity

application/telephone call with our solicitors/reviewed documentation/sent response to
ouir enlicitare/raviewad annlicatinn far adinnirnmaent and affidawvite

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

25/02/2022

0.30

$196.50

teleconference with our solicitors and counsel regarding outcome of court hearing today
in respect of EL liquidators adjournment application and indemnity application

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

25/02/2022

0.20

$131.00

reviewed counsels submissions regarding EL liquidators application to adjourn hearing of
indemnitv application/provided instructions reaarding same

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

1/03/2022

1.20

$786.00

reviewed transcript of court hearing of adjournment of separate questions application in
respect of Fl liauidators indemnitv application

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

4/03/2022

0.60

$393.00

reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
claim/reviewed draft letter to EL liquidators solicitors regarding separate questions
application and progression of indemnity application/provided instructions

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

16/03/2022

0.20

$131.00

reviewed correspondence from EL liquidators solicitors and our solicitors regarding

further steps in the EL liquidators indemnity application/reviewed draft letter/provided
inctriictinne reaardina came

BR

David Whyte

Appointee

Creditors

9/05/2022

0.30

$196.50

telephone call with our solicitors regarding Hall Chadwick's indemnity claim/progression
of same




BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 13/05/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed correspondence from Hall Chadwick's solicitors regarding further delays in
advising of their position on the indemnity claim/reviewed file regarding previous hearing
date/reviewed draft response/provided instructions regarding response

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 24/05/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators regarding indemnity
claim/sent response in relation to broaressina the matter

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 27/06/2022 0.70 $458.50|reviewed numerous change in details/transfer of units/deceased estate notifications and
transfers plus sunportina documentation/aboroved same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 12/07/2022 0.40 $262.00|meeting with our solicitors regarding EL liquidators claims/meeting to be held in respect
of same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 12/07/2022 0.50 $327.50|preparation for meeting with our solicitors regarding finalising claim from EL liquidators

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 13/07/2022 2.10 $1,375.50|reviewed material in relation to applications to finalise administration/prepared update to
investors

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 25/07/2022 0.10 $65.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators claims/progression
of outstanding applications/provided instructions regarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 31/07/2022 0.40 $262.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding
indemnitv claim/nrenared resnonse

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 4/08/2022 0.50 $327.50(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators claims/reviewed
draft application and supporting affidavit/provided instructions in relation to progression
of the matter

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 8/08/2022 0.10 $65.50(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
claim/potential apolication to court to dismiss proceedinas

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 11/08/2022 0.30 $196.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators indemnity
claims/reviewed two draft letters/nrovided instructions reaarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 11/08/2022 0.10 $65.50(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors/updated drafts of two letters to EL
liauidators solicitors reaardina claims aaainst the Fund/provided instructions

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 2/09/2022 0.40 $262.00(telephone call with our solicitors regarding correspondence received from EL
liauidators/next stens/meetina to be held on 5 September

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 5/09/2022 0.80 $524.00]|teleconference with Hall Chadwick and Charles Haines regarding claims against the
fund/potential settlement/call with CH following meeting/email our solicitors regarding
cottlamant

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 6/09/2022 0.20 $131.00(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding offer to settle claim against the
fund/reviewed terms/nrovided instructions reaardina same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 6/09/2022 0.10 $65.50(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding offer
to settle claims/reviewed draft response/provided instructions regarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 20/09/2022 0.40 $262.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding settlement of EL liquidators
claims/reviewed deed of settlement/provided instructions regarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 28/09/2022 0.30 $196.50(reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding updated draft deed of settlement
reaardina Fl liauidators claims/nrovided instriictions reaardina same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 25/10/2022 0.30 $196.50(reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding
proposed amendments to deed of settlement/email our solicitors regarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 27/10/2022 0.50 $327.50(|reviewed deed of settlement/proposed changes/considered key issues/emailed our
salicitors

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 27/10/2022 0.20 $131.00[telephone call with our solicitors regarding deed of settlement/provided instructions
reaarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 28/10/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding amendments to deed of
settlement/reviewed ubpdates to deed/pravided instructions reaarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 3/11/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding
proposed amendments to deed of settlement/provided instructions regarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 3/11/2022 0.20 $131.00(telephone call with our solicitors regarding deed of settlement/finalisation of same

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 30/11/2022 0.20 $131.00(|reviewed correspondence from investor regarding winding up/matters to finalise




BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 30/01/2023 0.30 $196.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding judicial advice
aonplication/reviewed draft application and draft affidavit

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 8/02/2023 0.70 $458.50|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators claims/reviewed my
draft affidavit and solicitors draft affidavit in respect of application for judicial
advica/nravided inctriictinne

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 8/02/2023 1.50 $982.50(reviewed affidavits and supporting documentation regarding judicial advice
annlication/resnonded to aueries raised bv ouir solicitors

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 8/02/2023 1.80 $1,179.00|detailed review of costs associated with dealing with EL liquidators claims for affidavit in
sunnort of iudicial advice annlication

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 8/02/2023 0.70 $458.50(|reviewed updated affidavit in support of judicial advice application/reviewed investor
correspondence relating to winding up/provided instructions regarding affidavit

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 13/02/2023 0.60 $393.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding EL liquidators claims and potential
claims against EL/reviewed previous affidavit in relation to claims/provided summary of
nncitinn cinca affidavit cwarn

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 15/02/2023 0.50 $327.50(teleconference with our solicitors and counsel regarding judicial advice application/issues
outstandina/finalisation of annlication

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 22/02/2023 1.10 $720.50(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding judicial advice
application/reviewed draft affidavit/reviewed documentation relating to queries
raiced/nrovided inctriictiong

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 22/02/2023 1.20 $786.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and counsel regarding judicial advice
aonplication/sent response

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 24/02/2023 0.80 $524.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding judicial advice
application/reviewed final drafts of material in support of the application/provided
inctriictinne

BR David Whyte Appointee Creditors 27/02/2023 0.60 $393.00(reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding judicial advice
application/reviewed application and supporting material/provided final instructions in
relation to affidavit

BR David Whyte Partner Creditors 13/03/2023 2.50 $1,637.50|attendance at court in relation to judicial advice application including meetings with our
salicitors and counsel

BR David Whyte Partner Creditors 13/03/2023 1.50 $982.50|attendance at court in relation to judicial advice application including meetings with our
salicitors and counsel

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 20/07/2021 0.40 $216.00|Review 15 letters and change of details forms to investors regarding updated details,
distributions. and review associated documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 23/08/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review and approve three letters to investors and change of details, review associated
documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 27/09/2021 0.20 $108.00(review five change of details requests and associated documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 27/09/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review three letters to investors

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 29/09/2021 0.10 $54.00|Ph call to investors regarding update and change of details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 8/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Two letters to unit holder with updates regarding balances and additional documentation
reauired

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 15/10/2021 0.20 $108.00|nine letters to investors regarding update and change of details - review associated
documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 15/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Four letters to investors regarding update and change of details - review associated
documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 15/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Four letters to investors regarding update and change of details - review associated
documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 25/10/2021 0.20 $108.00(Five letters to investors regarding unit balance calculations and additional information
required to update unit holdings. Review associated calculation workpapers and
ciinnartina material nrovidad hv invectare

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 25/10/2021 0.40 $216.00{Complex investor query - review background and liquidator reports regarding litigation to
nrovide resnonse

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 25/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review and authorise change of details, review complex letter regarding investor query
regarding litigation funding and insolvent trading claim by liquidator - obtain additional
infarmation for renlv

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 25/10/2021 0.10 $54.00(|Three letters to investors regarding unit balances updates and reprocessing of previous

distributions




BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 28/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review two letters to investors regarding update and litigation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 28/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Three change of investors details, including deceased estate of joint unitholders, review
associated documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 1/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Three Change of details requests

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 1/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Three letters to investors regarding change of details and unit balance updates

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 1/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Three letters to investors regarding change of details and additional information required
to undate database

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 4/11/2021 0.20 $108.00|Five letters and change of details from investors regarding updates and unit balance
confirmations

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 5/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review three letters to investors regarding updates and additional information required
to undate database

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 8/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review email from solicitors regarding court orders and mailing list

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 11/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review letters and change of details request for investors

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 16/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review three letters to investors regarding update and unit balance calculations

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 21/12/2021 0.20 $108.00|Eleven letters to investors regarding updates and change of details forms

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 29/03/2022 0.30 $166.50[21 letters to investors regarding documentation to update unit holdings and updates

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 29/03/2022 0.10 $55.50]|three letters to investors regarding documentation to update unit holdings and updates

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 11/04/2022 0.10 $55.50](three letters to investors regarding updates

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 21/04/2022 0.10 $55.50(five letters to investors

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 29/04/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve two letters to investors

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 17/05/2022 0.20 $111.00|Review 7letters to investors regarding unit balance updates, general updates and
additional information reauired to undate investor database

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 17/05/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review 3 letters to investors regarding unit balance updates, general updates and
additional information reauired to undate investor database

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 18/07/2022 0.20 $111.00|Review creditors update

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 19/07/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review two letters to investors regarding updates and additional information required to
undate investor database

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 21/07/2022 0.20 $111.00(4 letters to investors regarding updates and dividend

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 26/07/2022 0.10 $55.50][three letters to investors regarding unit balance update and change of details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 27/07/2022 0.10 $55.50|Two letters to investors regarding updates and change of details, review associated
documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 5/08/2022 0.10 $55.50(4 letters to investors regarding change of details and estimated value of investments

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 5/08/2022 0.20 $111.00[Six letters to investors regarding change of details, and updates in relation to
administration

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 15/08/2022 0.20 $111.00|Six change of details forms and letters to investors regarding documentation to update
details. Review associated documentation and database extracts

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 16/08/2022 0.10 $55.50(|Three letters to investors regarding additional information to update investor database

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 19/08/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve three letters to investors regarding updates and additional
information reauired

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 22/08/2022 0.10 $55.50[Review and approve email to investor

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 26/08/2022 0.10 $55.50]|three letters to investors regarding updates and change of details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 5/09/2022 0.60 $333.00|Teleconference with Hall Chadwick regarding proceedings

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 5/09/2022 0.40 $222.00|Post meeting discussion with appointee and file note regarding meeting and proposed
settlement

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 5/09/2022 0.20 $111.00|Meeting pre conference with appointee

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 7/09/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review correspondence to Liquidator regarding update




BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 7/09/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review legal correspondence and update

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 9/09/2022 0.10 $55.50|Three letters to investors regarding updates and change of details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 14/09/2022 0.10 $55.50{Two letters to investors, multiple holdings, regarding unit balance updates

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 15/09/2022 0.10 $55.50|Email and update regarding query regarding status and update staff

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 27/09/2022 0.10 $55.50(3 letters and change of details forms regarding unit holders updates. Review associated
documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 17/10/2022 0.10 $55.50|Two letters to investors regarding updated and unit balance updates, inc investor with
multiple holdinas. Review calculations and database extracts

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 17/10/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review change of details of deceased estate and split of holdings into 4. Review
will/probate and additional documentation (client details, transfer forms and ID) x 4 for
noaw haldinac

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 17/10/2022 0.10 $55.50|Two letters to unit holders regarding updates and change of details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 24/10/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review correspondence to investor with multiple investments regarding update and unit
balance undate on each investment

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 23/11/2022 0.20 $111.00(|Three letters to investors regarding updates and change of details, review associated
documentation reaardina database indates

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 12/12/2022 0.10 $55.50|Three change of details forms from investors, review database extracts

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 13/12/2022 0.20 $111.00|Eleven letters to investors regarding returned mail

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 16/12/2022 0.80 $444.00(24 Letters to investors regarding returned mail and requests to update investor details
via alternate contact details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 16/12/2022 0.50 $277.50(15 Letters to investors regarding returned mail and requests to update investor details
via alternate contact details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 16/12/2022 0.70 $388.50(22 Letters to investors regarding returned mail and requests to update investor details
via alternate contact details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 23/01/2023 0.30 $166.50(Six letters to investors regarding updates, and change of details forms regarding unit
reauests

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 27/01/2023 0.40 $222.00(|Eleven change of details and letters to investors regarding updates and changes of
details. review associated documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 27/01/2023 0.20 $111.00(9 change of details and letters to investors regarding updates and changes of details,
review associated documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 1/02/2023 0.20 $111.00(5 change of details forms and letters, review associated documentation and database
extracts.

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 9/02/2023 0.10 $55.50|Arrange IT access for staff preparation of responses to investors

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 2/03/2023 0.20 $111.00|Review and approve 8 letters to investors regarding updates and change of details
forms. review associated documentation and database extracts

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 3/03/2023 0.10 $55.50|Review 4 letters and change of details forms, associated documentation and database
extracts

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 20/03/2023 0.10 $55.50(|Three letters to investors regarding updates and change of details, review associated
documentation and database extracts

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 20/03/2023 0.10 $55.50|Four letters to investors regarding updates and change of details

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 28/03/2023 0.40 $222.00(33 letters to investors regarding returned mail and updates to database, review
associated database extracts

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 13/04/2023 0.20 $108.00[Review 5 change of details forms and associated documentation

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 17/04/2023 0.10 $54.00](3 letters and change of details forms. Review associated documentation and database
extracts

BR Charles Haines Director Creditors 21/04/2023 0.20 $108.00(Eleven Letters and change of details forms regarding updates, unit balance updates,
confirmation of changes. review associated documentation and database extracts

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 1/07/2021 0.60 $309.00|Liaise with Ryan Whyte re various affidavit queries in order to finalise same. Make
amendments to material

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 1/07/2021 2.40 $1,236.00|Update amendments to draft affidavits to finalise winding up and deal with equalisation

payments. Prepare responses to all queries from David Whyte and Gadens in relation to
draft material. Email to David Whyte for approval to send to Gadens.




BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 1/07/2021 0.40 $206.00]|Liaise with Ryan Whyte re various affidavit queries in order to finalise same. Make
amendments to material

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 2/07/2021 0.10 $51.50|Kwik copy quote request review, approval of email send

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 2/07/2021 0.80 $412.00|Meeting with Ryan Whyte re equalisation payment affidavit, final distribution calculations
etc

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 2/07/2021 0.10 $51.50|Instructions to Ryan Whyte re updating final distribution calculations.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 5/07/2021 1.10 $566.50|Review investigations undertaken by Ryan Whyte into Hardship payments and potential
set-off of same. Prepare summary in relation to set-off matters and recommendation to
ramnve from annalicatinn navment calcuilatinne

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 5/07/2021 1.50 $772.50|{Update and email draft response to Gadens queries with amendments to affidavit
material and instructions to prepare advice on various matters. Reply email to David
Whvte's fiirther alieries re material

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 6/07/2021 0.60 $309.00[Make further updates to draft affidavit material and finalise draft email to Gadens
regarding review of same and additional queries. Email draft email to David Whyte for
annraval tn raleace and nate additinnal aneriec

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 6/07/2021 0.90 $463.50|Update draft email to Gadens regarding review of 3x affidavits and Court application
documents to finalise windina un and deal with remainina matters.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 6/07/2021 0.30 $154.50|Review and consider final accounts requirement for winding up fund. Email to David
Whvte nrovidina details of review and oninion as to reauirements.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 7/07/2021 0.10 $51.50|Update and send email to Gadens re review/amendments to 4x affidavits

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 9/07/2021 0.20 $103.00(T/c from Gadens re clarification in relation to set-off removal from equalisation payment
affidavit.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 12/07/2021 0.10 $51.50|Meeting with Gadens re affidavit amendments

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 13/07/2021 0.10 $51.50|T/c from Gadens re affidavit clarification.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 16/07/2021 0.70 $360.50|Prepare estimate of costs for preparation of financial accounts for duration of
receivership. Liaise with Ryan Whyte re processes to complete same and email BDO
Avdit reaniectina meetina to fiirther review came

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 27/07/2021 1.80 $927.00|Review email from Gadens re amended draft material for application to court to finalise
receivership and pay equalisation payment. Review updated equalisation and final
distribution payments and liaise with Ryan Whyte re specific queries. Amend material

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 2/08/2021 0.10 $51.50|T/c Gadens re quote for sending auditor report and final accounts to investors. Liaise
with Rvan Whvte to obtain same from Kwik Kopv

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 2/08/2021 0.60 $309.00|Review and update equalisation payment affidavit material.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 3/08/2021 0.10 $51.50|Review and update draft email to Gadens re Kwik Kopy quotes summary.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 3/08/2021 0.10 $51.50|Review draft email and provide instructions to Ryan Whyte to amend email to Gadens re
summarising Kwik Kopv auotes for printina affidavit material

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 4/08/2021 0.40 $206.00|Meeting with Ryan Whyte re amendments to equalisation payment calculation
methodoloav for hardshin recibients

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 4/08/2021 0.20 $103.00][telephone call with David Whyte and Ryan Whyte regarding equalisation payment
calculations/finalisation of affidavit reaarding same

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 4/08/2021 0.40 $206.00|Meeting with Ryan Whyte re amended equalisation payment affidavit for hardship related
calculations. Review/update amendments and email to David Whyte.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 4/08/2021 0.10 $51.50|Reply email David Whyte re affidavit material review.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 5/08/2021 0.10 $51.50|Consider email from David Whyte re equalisation payment calculation queries. Arrange
teleconference to further discliss same.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 5/08/2021 0.10 $51.50|Review email from Ryan Whyte re equalisation payment calculation and affidavit
undates. Renlv email arranaina meetina to further disciiss same.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 5/08/2021 0.20 $103.00[Meeting with David Whyte and Ryan Whyte re equalisation payment calculation queries
and clarification.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 6/08/2021 0.70 $360.50(Finalise review of updated equalisation payment affidavit material and meeting. Update

draft email to Gadens re amendments, including to Linda Rickard affidavit. Email to
David Whwvte ta annrove came




BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 6/08/2021 1.10 $566.50|Review updated equalisation payment affidavit material and meeting with Ryan Whyte re
finalising same and review of Linda Rickard affidavit for hardship payment change of
mathadalanv imnacte

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 6/08/2021 0.10 $51.50|T/c Gadens re update on finalisation of equalisation payment affidavit material.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 6/08/2021 0.20 $103.00[Meeting with Ryan Whyte re hardship calculation amendments to equalisation payment.
Snot check review amendments made to 94 denasit TDs.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 6/08/2021 1.00 $515.00[{Meeting with Ryan Whyte re hardship calculation amendments to equalisation payment.
Snot check review amendments made to 94 denasit TDs.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 9/08/2021 0.20 $103.00(T/c from Gadens re amendments to affidavit, calculation methodology for hardship
navments and recommendation not to amend | inda Rickard affidavit.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 9/08/2021 0.20 $103.00[Review David Whyte's amendments to equalisation payment affidavit and update and
send email to Gadens re same and finalisina material for swearina.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 9/08/2021 0.20 $103.00[Meeting with David Whyte and Ryan Whyte re equalisation payment affidavit
amendments and undated calculations. Run throuah summary.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 11/08/2021 0.10 $51.50|T/c from Gadens re manual adjustment clarification for finalising affidavit material.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 1/09/2021 0.10 $51.50|Review Boddice orders and instructions from Gadens to notify investors of same.
Instriictions to Rvan Whvte to commence nrocess and uinload to wehsite.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 8/09/2021 0.10 $51.50|Phone call from Gadens re substituted service update.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 7/12/2021 0.10 $51.50|Review and approve 2x letters to investors re change of details requests.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 22/12/2021 0.30 $154.50[{Review and amend/approve 6x checklists/letters to investors/advisors re unit balances,
transfer of units. undate of details.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 20/01/2022 0.80 $424.00[Review, amend and approve 13 letters to investors/advisors re tfr of units, change of
details and unit balance requests. Review supporting docs. Review and approve 1x
navment reauicitiong for renrocecsina of dictribiitiong

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 22/02/2022 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve letters to investors re change of details/tfr of units.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 9/03/2022 0.30 $159.00|Review and amend/approve 5x letters to investors re change of details and tfr of units.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 23/03/2022 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve corro to investors re unit holdings.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 30/05/2022 0.20 $106.00|Review and approve 3x letters to investors re update on unit balances.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 16/06/2022 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve 2x Itr to investors re update on fund.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 19/10/2022 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve correspondence to investor re unit holding balance request.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 21/11/2022 0.20 $106.00|Review and update draft email to person claiming to be an investor of the fund.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 7/02/2023 0.10 $53.00|Review and sign letter to investor re update on unit holdings and transfer of units.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 10/03/2023 0.10 $53.00[Review and approve correspondence to 2x investors re unit balance requests.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 13/03/2023 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve reply correspondence to investor re multiple investment accounts
balances and reauirements to chanae details and transfer units

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 13/03/2023 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve correspondence to investor re unit balance request and transfer of
units reauirements

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 17/03/2023 0.20 $106.00|Review and approve 3x letters to investors re tfr of units, and unit balance requests.
Review supportina documents and checklists

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 20/03/2023 0.40 $212.00|Review and approve 3x letters to investors re update on winding up, transfer of units.
Review supporting documents. Settle updated wording for response template in light of
linnidatar'e claime heaina recalved

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 28/03/2023 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve 2x letters to investors re unitholding balances and estimated future
distributions to be made.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 30/03/2023 0.30 $159.00|Review and approve 5x change of details checklists and supporting docs. Review and
annrove 2x renlv letters to investors re transfer of units.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 11/04/2023 0.30 $159.00[Meeting with Ryan Whyte to review estimated final distribution calculations.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Creditors 11/04/2023 0.20 $106.00(Brief review of affidavit material for equalisation payment and finalisation, instructions

from David to undate etc.




BR

Jayden Coulston

Senior Manager

Creditors

13/04/2023

0.70

$371.00

Meeting with Ryan Whyte to undertake review of updated final distribution calculations to
support court affidavit material. Query specific formulae and comparison to previous
estimate. Request additional supporting calculations where necessary. Approve.

BR

Jayden Coulston

Senior Manager

Creditors

20/04/2023

$53.00

Review and approve email to Intersoft re equalisation payment, practical considerations.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/07/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/07/2021

$28.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/07/2021

$28.50

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/07/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/07/2021

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/07/2021

$28.50

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/07/2021

$28.50

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/07/2021

0.20

$57.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/07/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/07/2021

$28.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/07/2021

0.30

$85.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/07/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/07/2021

0.40

$114.00

2x Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/07/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/07/2021

0.10

$28.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/07/2021

0.30

$85.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/07/2021

0.30

$85.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecc reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/07/2021

$28.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/07/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

10




BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/07/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/07/2021

$28.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/07/2021

$28.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/07/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/07/2021

0.30

$85.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/07/2021

0.60

$171.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to 4x transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecc reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/08/2021

0.10

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/08/2021

$28.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/08/2021

$28.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/08/2021

$57.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/08/2021

$28.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/08/2021

$28.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/08/2021

0.20

$57.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/08/2021

0.20

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/08/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/08/2021

0.20

$57.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/08/2021

0.10

$28.50

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/08/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/08/2021

0.60

$171.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

0.30

$85.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

0.30

$85.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/09/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from investor in response to a confirmation of their request to transfer units.
Access investor management database to review current investor details and advise.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

9/09/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

9/09/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/09/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/09/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/09/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/09/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/09/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/09/2021

0.10

$28.50

Review debtor statement and reconcile to outstanding payments in MYOB.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/09/2021

0.10

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/09/2021

$28.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/09/2021

$28.50

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/09/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from investor in response to their request to transfer units from a superfund

to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/09/2021

0.30

$85.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/10/2021

0.60

$171.00

2x Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from

a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

0.20

$57.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

0.20

$57.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

$85.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

$28.50

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

$28.50

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

$28.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming transfer of units for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

$142.50

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/10/2021

0.30

$85.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

0.20

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming transfer of units for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

0.20

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

$142.50

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

$142.50

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

$28.50

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/10/2021

0.10

$28.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/11/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/11/2021

$28.50

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

0.60

$171.00

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

0.20

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/11/2021

0.10

$28.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/11/2021

$28.50

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/11/2021

0.30

$85.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

0.60

$171.00

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/11/2021

0.60

$171.00

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/11/2021

0.20

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2021

0.20

$57.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/11/2021

$28.50

Calls from investors /advisors
Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

0.30

$85.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecc reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

0.80

$228.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

$142.50

2x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

$114.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

$142.50

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

0.30

$85.50

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind'e nalicyv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

0.70

$199.50

4x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

0.30

$85.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar tha Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

0.20

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming transfer of units for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

0.20

$57.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

0.20

$57.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming transfer of units for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details
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BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 1/12/2021 0.10 $28.50|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
allary

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 1/12/2021 0.10 $28.50|Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a
deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 1/12/2021 0.30 $85.50|Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased
estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 2/12/2021 0.20 $57.00|2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 3/12/2021 0.30 $85.50|2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 21/12/2021 0.30 $85.50|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 21/12/2021 0.10 $28.50|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 21/12/2021 0.20 $57.00[Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 21/12/2021 0.10 $28.50|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
allary

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 21/12/2021 0.40 $114.00|{Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 21/12/2021 0.40 $114.00(2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 22/12/2021 0.40 $114.00|Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 23/12/2021 0.40 $114.00|Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 23/12/2021 1.10 $313.50|Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 10/01/2022 0.40 $140.00|2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 10/01/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 12/01/2022 0.60 $210.00(|3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 12/01/2022 0.20 $70.00|Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a
deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 12/01/2022 0.40 $140.00|2x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 12/01/2022 0.60 $210.00(3x Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracecc tn 1indate

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 13/01/2022 0.10 $35.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 13/01/2022 0.20 $70.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 13/01/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/01/2022

0.30

$105.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/01/2022

$175.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/01/2022

1.20

$420.00

6x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/01/2022

0.60

$210.00

3x Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the interim distribution to investors. Access
investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their request

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/01/2022

$175.00

Phone call with Ryan Whyte regarding next report to investors, winding up of the fund
template letters and proaression of court application

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/01/2022

0.30

$105.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2022

0.10

$35.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/01/2022

0.30

$105.00

Prepare payment of website hosting fees in MYOB and NAB. Send to JC/CH for review.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind'e nolicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/01/2022

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/01/2022

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare payment of FinPOWER invoice in MYOB and NAB. Email to CH/JC to
review/annroval.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/01/2022

0.20

$70.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/01/2022

0.10

$35.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/01/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/02/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
management database to review current details

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/02/2022

0.30

$105.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/02/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/02/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2022

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2022

$35.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2022

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/02/2022

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/02/2022

$105.00

2x Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from

a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/02/2022

$175.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/02/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/02/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/02/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/02/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/03/2022

0.30

$105.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/03/2022

$175.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/03/2022

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/03/2022

$175.00

2x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/03/2022

$175.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/03/2022

0.70

$245.00

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

4/03/2022

0.30

$105.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac naer the Fiind'e nalicyv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

4/03/2022

0.80

$280.00

4x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind'e nolicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecc reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

9/03/2022

0.30

$105.00

Phone call with RW re Fund timeline and outcome of latest Court days.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2022

0.30

$105.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2022

0.30

$105.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2022

0.30

$105.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2022

0.70

$245.00

3x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

2x Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/03/2022

0.10

$35.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/03/2022

$35.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/03/2022

0.30

$105.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/03/2022

$35.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/03/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind'e nolicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2022

0.10

$35.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2022

0.60

$210.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2022

1.20

$420.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2022

$525.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/03/2022

1.00

$350.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

4/04/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

$175.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2022

$35.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2022

0.20

$70.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecc reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2022

0.70

$245.00

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from

a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.30

$105.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.30

$105.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.30

$105.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.70

$245.00

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecc reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.20

$70.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/04/2022

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/04/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/04/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/04/2022

0.30

$105.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/05/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/05/2022

$35.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/05/2022

$35.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/05/2022

0.60

$210.00

3x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/05/2022

0.10

$35.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/05/2022

0.10

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/05/2022

0.30

$105.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/05/2022

0.30

$105.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/05/2022

0.30

$105.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
management database to review current details

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/05/2022

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/05/2022

0.30

$105.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/05/2022

0.40

$140.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/05/2022

$35.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/05/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind'e nolicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Phone call from investor in response to their request to transfer units from a superfund

to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invactar dataile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/05/2022

0.60

$210.00

3x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/05/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invactar dataile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/05/2022

$35.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/05/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecc reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/05/2022

0.30

$105.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/05/2022

0.70

$245.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/05/2022

0.60

$210.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/06/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/06/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/06/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicyv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/06/2022

$175.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/06/2022

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary
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BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 24/06/2022 0.20 $70.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 4/07/2022 0.20 $70.00|Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 6/07/2022 0.20 $70.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 19/07/2022 0.40 $140.00(2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 2/08/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
allary

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 2/08/2022 0.20 $70.00[Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 2/08/2022 0.20 $70.00|Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a
deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 15/08/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 18/08/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
allary

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 23/08/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 26/08/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
allary

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 2/09/2022 0.30 $105.00[Phone call from investor in response to their request to transfer units from a superfund
to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invectonr detaile and advice

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 5/09/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
allary

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 5/09/2022 0.10 $35.00[Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 9/09/2022 0.10 $35.00[Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 9/09/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 9/09/2022 0.10 $35.00|Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 9/09/2022 0.40 $140.00[2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 9/09/2022 0.10 $35.00|Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 20/09/2022 0.20 $70.00|Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
nindate

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Creditors 29/09/2022 0.20 $70.00|Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/09/2022

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/12/2022

$35.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2022

$175.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind’c nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2022

0.30

$105.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind’c nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/12/2022

$35.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/12/2022

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/12/2022

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/01/2023

$35.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/01/2023

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/01/2023

0.20

$70.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/02/2023

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/02/2023

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/02/2023

0.30

$105.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/02/2023

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecce reaiiect ac nar the Fiind’c nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/02/2023

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind’e nolicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/03/2023

0.30

$105.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/03/2023

$35.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.
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BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind’c nalicyv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/03/2023

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/03/2023

0.30

$105.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind’c nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/03/2023

$35.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/03/2023

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2023

0.30

$105.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind’c nalicy

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

0.40

$140.00

2x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

$35.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Jordan Devery

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$70.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/07/2021

1.20

$408.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/07/2021

1.20

$408.00

Prepare 6 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
process to update.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/07/2021

0.60

$204.00

Prepare 3 letters to investors confirming update of details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details.
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/07/2021

1.40

$476.00

Prepare 7 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
process to update.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/07/2021

1.00

$340.00

Review of correspondence from 5 investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
request as per the Funds policy.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/07/2021

$374.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/07/2021

1.00

$340.00

Review of correspondence from 5 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/07/2021

0.40

$136.00

Prepare 2 letters to investors confirming transfer of units for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/07/2021

0.90

$306.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/07/2021

0.60

$204.00

Review of correspondence from 6 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/07/2021

1.20

$408.00

Review of correspondence from 6 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/07/2021

0.20

$68.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/07/2021

0.20

$68.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/08/2021

0.90

$306.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/08/2021

0.60

$204.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/09/2021

0.40

$136.00

Prepare 2 letters to investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/09/2021

0.70

$238.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/09/2021

0.80

$272.00

Prepare 4 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/09/2021

0.60

$204.00

Prepare 3 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/09/2021

0.40

$136.00

Prepare 2 letters to investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/09/2021

0.60

$204.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/09/2021

0.30

$102.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/09/2021

0.20

$68.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/10/2021

0.20

$68.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/10/2021

0.40

$136.00

Prepare 2 letters to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from

a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/10/2021

0.30

$102.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

0.80

$272.00

Prepare 4 letters to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from

a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

0.20

$68.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/10/2021

0.30

$102.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/10/2021

0.60

$204.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/10/2021

$170.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/10/2021

$170.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/10/2021

$34.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/10/2021

0.30

$102.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm
details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their

allary

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/10/2021

1.00

$340.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

0.20

$68.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

1.80

$612.00

Review of correspondence from 9 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

1.00

$340.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

0.20

$68.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/10/2021

1.00

$340.00

Reviewed and approved 10 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/10/2021

0.30

$102.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/10/2021

$170.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/10/2021

0.40

$136.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/10/2021

0.70

$238.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaaced actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

4/11/2021

1.00

$340.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

4/11/2021

$714.00

Review of correspondence from 13 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.80

$272.00

Review of correspondence from 4 investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.90

$306.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.30

$102.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/11/2021

0.70

$238.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

9/11/2021

1.20

$408.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

0.30

$102.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

0.90

$306.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/11/2021

0.80

$272.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2021

0.60

$204.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2021

0.80

$272.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/11/2021

0.40

$136.00

Review of voicemails from Investors. Access investor management database to confirm

details & prepare requested information to call back. Call investor back regarding their
aliery

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/11/2021

0.30

$102.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/11/2021

0.80

$272.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/11/2021

0.20

$68.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/11/2021

0.40

$136.00

Prepare 2 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/11/2021

$170.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

0.20

$68.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/12/2021

1.00

$340.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/12/2021

0.60

$204.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/12/2021

$170.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2021

$272.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/12/2021

$374.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/12/2021

0.20

$68.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/01/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/01/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/01/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/02/2022

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/02/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2022

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/03/2022

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/03/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2022

$585.00

Reviewed and approved 15 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2022

0.60

$234.00

Prepare 3 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/03/2022

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/03/2022

1.20

$468.00

Prepare 6 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2022

0.70

$273.00

Scanned multiple documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to
reauired investor via email or bost

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2022

$195.00

Scanned multiple documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to
reauired investor via email or bost

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review March BAS and provide to Charles/Jayden for approval.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2022

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2022

0.80

$312.00

Review of correspondence from 4 investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/04/2022

1.30

$507.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/04/2022

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

4/05/2022

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.40

$156.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/05/2022

0.40

$156.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/05/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/05/2022

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/05/2022

1.20

$468.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/05/2022

1.30

$507.00

Prepare the 37th update report to creditors, update legal matters, prepare receipts and
pavments and estimated return

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/05/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/05/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/05/2022

$39.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/05/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaaced actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/05/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/05/2022

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/05/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/06/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/06/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/06/2022

0.30

$117.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/06/2022

0.40

$156.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

9/06/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/06/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/06/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/06/2022

$585.00

Prepare the 37th update report to creditors including legal proceedings, estimated return
and receints and navments.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/06/2022

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/07/2022

$429.00

Prepare receipts and payments for entire appointment to enter into the 37th update
renort to creditors

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/07/2022

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/07/2022

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/07/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

13/07/2022

0.90

$351.00

Update the 37th report to investors and send to our solicitors for review

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/07/2022

1.20

$468.00

Reviewed and approved 15 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/07/2022

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 14 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/07/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaaced actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/07/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/07/2022

0.20

$78.00

Prepare payment of invoice in INSOL6 and online banking

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/07/2022

1.10

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/07/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/07/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/07/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/07/2022

1.30

$507.00

Reviewed and approved 12 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

1/08/2022

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/08/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/08/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

4/08/2022

$390.00

Reviewed change of details forms from 8 investors, prepared checklist and payment in
INSOL6 and online banking to reprocess the interim distribution to the investor

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/08/2022

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/08/2022

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/08/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/08/2022

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/08/2022

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/08/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/08/2022

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to an investor in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/08/2022

$39.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/08/2022

1.40

$546.00

Reviewed and approved 10 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

23/08/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/08/2022

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/08/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/08/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/08/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/08/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/09/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/09/2022

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/09/2022

$39.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/09/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/09/2022

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/09/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/09/2022

0.50

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/09/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/09/2022

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

29/09/2022

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

4/10/2022

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

5/10/2022

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2022

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/10/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

10/10/2022

1.20

$468.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/10/2022

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/10/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

12/10/2022

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2022

0.30

$117.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaaced actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/10/2022

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/10/2022

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/10/2022

1.40

$546.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/10/2022

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/10/2022

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2022

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2022

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

8/11/2022

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

9/11/2022

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/11/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2022

$117.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/11/2022

$195.00

Reviewed and approved 3 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

11/01/2023

1.40

$546.00

Reviewed and approved 10 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/01/2023

0.50

$195.00

Prepare estimated return to finalisation

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

18/01/2023

1.40

$546.00

Reviewed and approved 14 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/01/2023

0.40

$156.00

Reviewed and approved 4 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2023

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/01/2023

1.20

$468.00

Prepare 6 letters to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from

a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/01/2023

1.20

$468.00

Prepare 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

25/01/2023

0.60

$234.00

Prepare 3 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/01/2023

1.60

$624.00

Prepare 8 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/01/2023

1.60

$624.00

Prepare 8 letters to executors of estate in response to their request to transfer units

from a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/01/2023

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

30/01/2023

2.00

$780.00

Prepare 10 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/01/2023

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/02/2023

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 11 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/02/2023

1.40

$546.00

Reviewed and approved 13 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2023

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2023

0.20

$78.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

16/02/2023

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

15/03/2023

$585.00

Reviewed and approved 14 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2023

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 12 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

20/03/2023

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2023

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

22/03/2023

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 12 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

24/03/2023

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

31/03/2023

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaaced actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

3/04/2023

0.90

$351.00

Reviewed and approved 8 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2023

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 6 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

1.00

$390.00

Reviewed and approved 9 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

17/04/2023

$429.00

Reviewed and approved 11 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2023

0.80

$312.00

Reviewed and approved 7 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

26/04/2023

0.60

$234.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

27/04/2023

1.20

$468.00

Reviewed and approved 13 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
deceaced ectate

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Creditors

28/04/2023

0.70

$273.00

Reviewed and approved 5 letters to investors in relation to a request for a change of

details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer of units for
dacaacad actata

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of trustee request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

0.40

$92.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

0.30

$69.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

0.30

$69.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/08/2021

$115.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

0.60

$138.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

0.30

$69.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

$115.00

2 x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicyv
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

1.00

$230.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the trustee for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/08/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

23/08/2021

$115.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/08/2021

0.40

$92.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

26/08/2021

1.00

$230.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

26/08/2021

$115.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

26/08/2021

0.20

$46.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/08/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/08/2021

$23.00

Phone call from investor in response to their request to transfer units from a superfund

to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invactar dataile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/08/2021

$460.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

31/08/2021

$23.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/09/2021

$23.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/09/2021

$23.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/09/2021

0.40

$92.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/09/2021

0.60

$138.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/09/2021

0.20

$46.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/09/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

23/09/2021

$115.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

23/09/2021

0.20

$46.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/09/2021

0.20

$46.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/09/2021

0.30

$69.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/10/2021

0.40

$92.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

6/10/2021

$115.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

$69.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

$115.00

2 x Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/10/2021

0.40

$92.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/10/2021

$115.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/10/2021

$115.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units and unit
balance from a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor
management database to review current investor details and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Multiple preparing letters to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer
units from a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor
mananament datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

$23.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.60

$138.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.10

$23.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of trustee request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/10/2021

$23.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

0.40

$92.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/10/2021

0.10

$23.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/10/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

2 x Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

$23.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

0.50

$115.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request for a unit balance and to
transfer units from a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor
management database to review current investor details and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/10/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/10/2021

0.40

$92.00

6 x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/10/2021

$23.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/10/2021

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/10/2021

$23.00

3 x Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/10/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/10/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/10/2021

$69.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/10/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/10/2021

$46.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/10/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/10/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

0.40

$92.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

0.40

$92.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/11/2021

0.40

$92.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

4/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

12 x Reviewed and approved a checklist to an investor in relation to a request for a

change of details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer
of 1inite for deceaced ectate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

12 x Reviewed and approved a checklist to an investor in relation to a request for a

change of details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer
of 1inite for deceaced ectate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/11/2021

0.40

$92.00

12 x Reviewed and approved a checklist to an investor in relation to a request for a

change of details/unit holding balance/confirmation of change/transfer of units/transfer
of ninite for deceaced actate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/11/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/11/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

42




BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/11/2021

$23.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/11/2021

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

$69.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

$23.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecce reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/11/2021

$23.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/11/2021

$23.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/11/2021

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/11/2021

$46.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/11/2021

$23.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/11/2021

$23.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

23/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

29/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind'e nolicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

29/11/2021

$23.00

18 x Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

29/11/2021

0.40

$92.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

29/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming transfer of units for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

29/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

$23.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/11/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/12/2021

$23.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/12/2021

$23.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/12/2021

$23.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/12/2021

$23.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/12/2021

0.40

$92.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Call
investor to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/12/2021

0.20

$46.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/12/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/12/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/12/2021

0.20

$46.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/12/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/12/2021

0.30

$69.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/12/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/12/2021

0.20

$46.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/12/2021

0.60

$138.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/12/2021

$115.00

15 x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance.
Access investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/12/2021

$23.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/12/2021

$184.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/12/2021

$46.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/12/2021

$23.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/12/2021

$23.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/12/2021

$23.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2021

0.20

$46.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/12/2021

0.20

$46.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the trustee for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

23/12/2021

0.20

$46.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/01/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/01/2022

$24.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/01/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/01/2022

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/01/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/01/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/01/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/01/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/01/2022

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/01/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/01/2022

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2022

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2022

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/01/2022

0.30

$72.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/01/2022

0.30

$72.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/01/2022

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/02/2022

$24.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2022

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2022

0.30

$72.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2022

0.40

$96.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/02/2022

$24.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/02/2022

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/02/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2022

$24.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

$24.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

$24.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

$24.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2022

$24.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/02/2022

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/02/2022

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/02/2022

$24.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/02/2022

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/02/2022

0.30

$72.00

Preparing payment to finPOWER for monthly license fee in MYOB and in NAB.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/02/2022

0.40

$96.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

2/03/2022

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/03/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/03/2022

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/03/2022

0.10

$24.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/03/2022

0.40

$96.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/03/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2022

0.40

$96.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2022

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracecc reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/03/2022

0.30

$72.00

Preparing MYOB and NAB requisition for payment to Gadens for February legal fees.
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/03/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2022

0.10

$24.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2022

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2022

0.10

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

31/03/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/04/2022

0.30

$72.00

Preparing MYOB and NAB payment to finPOWER for monthly license fee.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/04/2022

0.30

$72.00

Preparing MYOB and NAB payment to Gadens for legal fees.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2022

0.10

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

0.40

$96.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming transfer of units for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/04/2022

0.10

$24.00

Call from an adviser seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2022

0.30

$72.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2022

0.30

$72.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2022

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2022

0.40

$96.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2022

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/04/2022

$24.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/04/2022

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/04/2022

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/04/2022

$24.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/04/2022

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/04/2022

0.50

$120.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/04/2022

0.40

$96.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/04/2022

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

26/04/2022

0.40

$96.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/04/2022

$120.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/04/2022

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/04/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/05/2022

0.30

$72.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/05/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

4/05/2022

$24.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

4/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

$120.00

5 x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/05/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

6/05/2022

0.40

$96.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

6/05/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.
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BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 6/05/2022 0.10 $24.00|Phone call from investor in response to a confirmation of their request to transfer units.
Access investor management database to review current investor details and advise.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 6/05/2022 0.10 $24.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 10/05/2022 0.50 $120.00(2 x Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 11/05/2022 0.10 $24.00|Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be
updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 11/05/2022 0.10 $24.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 11/05/2022 0.30 $72.00|Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 13/05/2022 0.20 $48.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 13/05/2022 0.20 $48.00|Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 13/05/2022 0.10 $24.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 17/05/2022 0.10 $24.00|Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 18/05/2022 0.30 $72.00|Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 18/05/2022 0.20 $48.00|Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 19/05/2022 0.60 $144.00|Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 1/06/2022 0.10 $24.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 1/06/2022 0.30 $72.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 6/06/2022 0.20 $48.00|Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
nndate

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 7/06/2022 0.10 $24.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 7/06/2022 0.20 $48.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 15/06/2022 0.20 $48.00|Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a
deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 16/06/2022 0.10 $24.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 16/06/2022 0.30 $72.00|Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaagement database to review current details.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 27/06/2022 0.20 $48.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 28/06/2022 0.10 $24.00[Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 5/07/2022 0.30 $72.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 6/07/2022 0.20 $48.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 6/07/2022 0.20 $48.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 7/07/2022 0.20 $48.00[Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 7/07/2022 0.20 $48.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 8/07/2022 0.20 $48.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/07/2022

1.40

$336.00

Building asset impairments master spreadsheet for purposes of financial accounts for
impairments of the loans

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/07/2022

0.40

$96.00

Building asset impairments master spreadsheet for purposes of financial accounts for
impairments of the loans

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/07/2022

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/07/2022

0.30

$72.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/07/2022

0.60

$144.00

3 x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/07/2022

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/07/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/07/2022

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/07/2022

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

26/07/2022

$29.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/07/2022

0.30

$88.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/07/2022

0.20

$59.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/07/2022

$29.50

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

29/07/2022

0.50

$147.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

29/07/2022

0.10

$29.50

Call from an investor seeking information in regards to the interim distribution from the
fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/08/2022

0.20

$59.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/08/2022

0.40

$118.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/08/2022

0.40

$118.00

Prepare letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/08/2022

0.40

$118.00

Prepare letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/08/2022

0.40

$118.00

Prepare letters to investors in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/08/2022

$147.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/08/2022

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

4/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

4/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Prepare letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Prepare letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

5/08/2022

0.20

$59.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/08/2022

0.10

$29.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/08/2022

0.10

$29.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/08/2022

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/08/2022

0.40

$118.00

Phone call from investor in response to a confirmation of their request to change details.
Access investor management database to review current investor details and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/08/2022

0.20

$59.00

Prepare letter to investor on update of the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
management database to review current details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/08/2022

0.20

$59.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/08/2022

0.40

$118.00

2 x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

23/08/2022

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/08/2022

0.50

$147.50

Prepare letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/08/2022

0.30

$88.50

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/08/2022

0.20

$59.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate
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BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 25/08/2022 0.20 $59.00|Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracacc tn 1indata

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 26/08/2022 0.20 $59.00|Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracecc tn 1indate

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 9/09/2022 0.50 $147.50|Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a
deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 9/09/2022 0.90 $265.50[{Research on process to lodge unclaimed monies for an investment scheme to ASIC.
Reviewed ASIC websites to verify funds lodged for all types of investors i.e. individuals,
comnaniec and triicte

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 30/09/2022 0.40 $118.00|Reviewed invoice/prepared payment for license fee to maintain investor database. Saved
reauisition documents to file

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 4/10/2022 0.60 $177.00|Reviewed invoices/prepared payments for September barrister and legal fees. Saved to
file

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 18/10/2022 0.20 $59.00|Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 18/10/2022 0.40 $118.00|Prepare letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 19/10/2022 0.10 $29.50|Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 19/10/2022 0.10 $29.50|Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 19/10/2022 0.10 $29.50|Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be
updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accordinalyv

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 19/10/2022 0.10 $29.50|Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 10/11/2022 0.20 $59.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 10/11/2022 0.30 $88.50|Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
raaiiact

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 29/11/2022 0.10 $29.50|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 30/11/2022 0.30 $88.50|Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a
deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 1/12/2022 0.20 $59.00|Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be
updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalyv

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 1/12/2022 0.10 $29.50(Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 8/12/2022 1.20 $354.00[Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letters to reauest new address details.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 12/12/2022 0.30 $88.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 12/12/2022 0.80 $236.00[Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 12/12/2022 0.50 $147.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 12/12/2022 0.80 $236.00[Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Creditors 12/12/2022 1.70 $501.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare

letter to reauest new address details.

95




BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/12/2022

0.10

$29.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/12/2022

2.80

$826.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/12/2022

$147.50

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/12/2022

0.80

$236.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/12/2022

0.30

$88.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/12/2022

$29.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/12/2022

$147.50

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/12/2022

0.30

$88.50

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/12/2022

0.40

$118.00

Prepare letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

15/12/2022

0.30

$88.50

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2022

1.40

$413.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2022

0.20

$59.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

16/12/2022

1.00

$295.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/01/2023

0.30

$88.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/01/2023

$29.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/01/2023

$29.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/01/2023

0.30

$88.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/01/2023

0.60

$177.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/01/2023

0.30

$88.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/01/2023

$29.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

19/01/2023

$88.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/01/2023

$29.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

20/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2023

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/01/2023

$29.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

25/01/2023

$147.50

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/02/2023

0.40

$118.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

3/02/2023

0.30

$88.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

6/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2023

0.30

$88.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

7/02/2023

$29.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/02/2023

$29.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/02/2023

0.40

$118.00

Prepare letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/02/2023

$29.50

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

8/02/2023

$29.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/02/2023

0.30

$88.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/02/2023

0.30

$88.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/02/2023

$29.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

10/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/02/2023

0.30

$88.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/02/2023

0.10

$29.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2023

$29.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2023

0.60

$177.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/02/2023

0.60

$177.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2023

0.30

$88.50

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/02/2023

0.40

$118.00

Prepare letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/02/2023

$29.50

Phone call from investor in response to their request to transfer units from a superfund

to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/02/2023

$29.50

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

27/02/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

1/03/2023

0.20

$59.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

9/03/2023

0.20

$59.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2023

0.20

$59.00

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal nhame. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

0.80

$236.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv
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BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

0.20

$59.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

0.20

$59.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

0.40

$118.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac naer the Fiind'e nalicyv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2023

$147.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

24/03/2023

1.40

$413.00

Preparation of R&P section and other sections within EIF report to creditors.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2023

0.20

$59.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2023

0.40

$118.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

11/04/2023

$29.50

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2023

$29.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2023

0.30

$88.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind'e nolicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2023

0.70

$206.50

Updated Receipts & Payments within 38th report to investors.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2023

0.30

$88.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

0.30

$88.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

$29.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicyv

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/04/2023

0.30

$88.50

Prepared payment of monthly IT maintenance expense for finPOWER investor server.

BR

Nigel Wenck

Analyst

Creditors

28/04/2023

0.90

$265.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

15/02/2023

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

15/02/2023

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

16/02/2023

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

16/02/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv
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BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

16/02/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

17/02/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

22/02/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

23/02/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

2/03/2023

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

2/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

2/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind’c nalicv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

3/03/2023

$600.00

8 x Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

9/03/2023

$120.00

6 x Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

9/03/2023

$72.00

7 x Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

10/03/2023

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

10/03/2023

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

10/03/2023

$120.00

2 x Updated and Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off
documents to reauired investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

10/03/2023

$72.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

13/03/2023

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

15/03/2023

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinaly

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

$96.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2023

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2023

0.60

$144.00

4 x Review of correspondence from investors/advisors in relation to a change of details

request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to
nraceacc raniiact ac nar tha Fiind’c nalicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

22/03/2023

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

23/03/2023

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

24/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv
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BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

27/03/2023

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

27/03/2023

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

27/03/2023

$24.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accardinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2023

$48.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be
updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accordingly. Sent correspondence to the correct address

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2023

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2023

$72.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

4/04/2023

$24.00

Draft a new accounts payable for Gadens' legal fees for period ending 31.03. Saved
supporting documentation to file and forwarded to manager for reviewal/ payment

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

4/04/2023

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2023

1.20

$288.00

33 x Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to
reauired investor via email or bost

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2023

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2023

0.40

$96.00

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super
Fund to their personal nhame. Access investor management database to review current
investor details and advise. Make changes to data base as required

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

3 x Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind’e nolicv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

$24.00

2 x Update for Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details

request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to
nraceacc raniiact ac nar tha Fiind’c nalicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

17/04/2023

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

$24.00

2 x Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.
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BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

0.30

$72.00

3 x Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2023

$24.00

Review of unread emails sent to the Fund’s mailbox. Print email for letter response to be

updated in the Fund’s database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accaordinalv

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2023

$72.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2023

$24.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2023

$24.00

2 x update letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor manaaement database to review current details

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

20/04/2023

$24.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

21/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

21/04/2023

0.50

$120.00

5 x Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

26/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

27/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

2 x Update letters to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Georgia Frank

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/04/2023

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

1/03/2023

0.80

$192.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind’c nalicyv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

1/03/2023

$120.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

2/03/2023

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

2/03/2023

0.60

$144.00

Prepare letters to investors in relation to requests for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investors and print investors balances.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

2/03/2023

$120.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming transfer of units for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

2/03/2023

0.40

$96.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind’c nalicyv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

3/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

6/03/2023

1.30

$312.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

6/03/2023

0.30

$72.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

7/03/2023

0.40

$96.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

7/03/2023

0.30

$72.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

8/03/2023

$24.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise
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BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

8/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2023

0.30

$72.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Phone call from investor in response to their request to transfer units from a superfund

to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invactar dataile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

15/03/2023

0.40

$96.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

0.40

$96.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind’e nolicv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

16/03/2023

$24.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the interim distribution to investors. Access
investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their request

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2023

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

17/03/2023

$24.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

20/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

20/03/2023

0.40

$96.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2023

0.60

$144.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

21/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

22/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

23/03/2023

0.30

$72.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind’c nalicyv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

24/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

27/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

27/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

27/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicyv
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BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

27/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.30

$72.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

28/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invactar dataile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

29/03/2023

0.20

$48.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

30/03/2023

0.40

$96.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

4/04/2023

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

5/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

5/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

5/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv
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BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

6/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

11/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

11/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

12/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2023

$24.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

13/04/2023

$24.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

$24.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming transfer of units for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

$120.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind’s nolicy

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

14/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

17/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

17/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

17/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal nhame. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv
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BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

18/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2023

0.30

$72.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

19/04/2023

$24.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units. Access
investor management database to review current investor details and advise.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

21/04/2023

0.10

$24.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

21/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

21/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

26/04/2023

$24.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jason Morcom

Graduate Analyst

Creditors

26/04/2023

0.20

$48.00

Prepare letter to investor to request id as their signature could not be matched to the
database.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/06/2022

1.20

$234.00

Prepared letters to 5 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/06/2022

0.80

$156.00

Review of correspondence from 3 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/06/2022

0.60

$117.00

Prepare letters to 4 investors confirming update of details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor manaagement database to review current details.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/06/2022

1.40

$273.00

Prepare letters to 7 executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from

a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

24/06/2022

1.00

$195.00

Prepare letter to 8 investor confirming update of details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor manaaement database to review current details

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

24/06/2022

0.80

$156.00

Prepare letter to 7 investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

24/06/2022

$214.50

Review of correspondence from 6 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

1/07/2022

0.90

$175.50

Prepare letter to 5 executors of estate in response to their request to transfer units from

a deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

4/07/2022

1.00

$195.00

Review of correspondence from 5 investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind’c nolicv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

4/07/2022

$97.50

Review of correspondence from 5 investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind’c nalicyv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

5/07/2022

1.20

$234.00

Review of correspondence from 8 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

8/07/2022

1.20

$234.00

Prepare letter to 4 investors in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invactar dataile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

8/07/2022

1.00

$195.00

Prepare a letter to 3 investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.
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BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

11/07/2022

1.20

$234.00

Prepare 6 letters to investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

12/07/2022

1.00

$195.00

Review of correspondence from 3 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

12/07/2022

$214.50

Prepare a letter to 4 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

15/07/2022

0.70

$136.50

Prepare a letter to 4 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/07/2022

0.80

$156.00

Prepare a letter to 5 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

19/07/2022

0.80

$156.00

Prepare 4 letters to investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

19/07/2022

0.60

$117.00

Prepare letter to 2 investors in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invactar dataile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

19/07/2022

0.80

$156.00

Prepare a letter to 3 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

22/07/2022

0.80

$156.00

Prepare a letter to 3 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/07/2022

0.70

$136.50

Prepare a letter to 3 investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/07/2022

$97.50

Prepare letter to 2 investors confirming update of details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor manaaement database to review current details

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

3/08/2022

0.70

$136.50

Prepare letter to 5 investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

3/08/2022

0.70

$136.50

Prepare a letter to 3 investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

4/08/2022

0.80

$156.00

Prepare a letter to 4 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

5/08/2022

0.60

$117.00

Prepare letter to 4 investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

5/08/2022

0.60

$117.00

Prepare a letter to 3 investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

15/08/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare a letter to 2 investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

16/08/2022

0.70

$136.50

Prepare a letter to 4 investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

16/08/2022

0.60

$117.00

Prepare a letter to 3 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

19/08/2022

0.60

$117.00

Prepare a letter to 2 investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.
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BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

23/08/2022

0.90

$175.50

Prepare a letter to 3 investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

26/08/2022

0.30

$58.50

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

26/08/2022

$292.50

Review of 4 correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiind'e nolicv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

26/08/2022

0.80

$156.00

Scanned 16 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

29/08/2022

0.80

$156.00

Prepare letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

29/08/2022

0.40

$78.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

30/08/2022

0.40

$78.00

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaagement database and advise.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

6/09/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

12/09/2022

0.30

$58.50

Scanned 3 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

13/09/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/09/2022

0.80

$156.00

Review of correspondence from 4 investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/09/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare a letter to 2 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/09/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

23/09/2022

$19.50

Scanned document and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

23/09/2022

0.20

$39.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

23/09/2022

0.10

$19.50

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access inve to review current details

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

26/09/2022

0.10

$19.50

Scanned 2 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

27/09/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

27/09/2022

$97.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance and

deceased estate enquiry. Access investor management database, search for investor and
nrint invectar halance

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

29/09/2022

$58.50

Scanned 3 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

29/09/2022

$97.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nracece reaiiect ac nar the Fiind'e nalicy

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

29/09/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

29/09/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare a letter to 2 investors in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact
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BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

30/09/2022

0.30

$58.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

30/09/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned 2 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

30/09/2022

0.60

$117.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased

estate request. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided
tn nrocecc reaiiect ac ner the Fiind's nolicy

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

4/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

7/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned 3 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

10/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

10/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate seeking to update the details for their investment

with the Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and
advice nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

10/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

11/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

14/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

14/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

14/10/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

14/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

14/10/2022

$19.50

Scanned document and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

17/10/2022

0.80

$156.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units of deceased
estate request to 4 beneficiaries. Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient
documentation provided to process request as per the Fund's policy.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

17/10/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

17/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

17/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned 4 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

17/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal nhame. Access investor management database to review current
invectar detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

17/10/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reaiiect ac ner the Fiinde nalicv
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BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/10/2022

0.10

$19.50

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/10/2022

0.70

$136.50

Prepare a letter to adviser in relation to a request for a unit holding balance for 2

investors. Access investor management database, search for investor and print investor
halance

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned 2 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Phone call from investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and advise process to
1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

24/10/2022

$19.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

24/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Call from an investor in relation to a request for an updated unit holdings balance.
Review investor on the investor manaaement database and advise

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned 2 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nalicwv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Phone call from investor in response to a confirmation of their request to transfer units.
Access investor management database to review current investor details and advise.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/10/2022

0.20

$39.00

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/10/2022

$19.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

25/10/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to investor confirming update of details for their investment with the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

31/10/2022

0.10

$19.50

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

14/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

14/11/2022

$97.50

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to change details from a Super

Fund as trustee has passed away. Access investor management database to review
currant invector detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

14/11/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

15/11/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare letter to 2 investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

15/11/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

15/11/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the winding up of the Fund. Access investor
manaaement database. search for investor and nrint investor balance.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

15/11/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned 6 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiinde nolicwv
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BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/11/2022

0.70

$136.50

Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.

Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac nar the Fiind'e nalicyv

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/11/2022

$19.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Phone call from executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

18/11/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a

deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
datahace tn review ciirrent invactar detaile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/11/2022

0.40

$78.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/11/2022

$19.50

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

21/11/2022

$19.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

22/11/2022

$39.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

22/11/2022

$19.50

Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units from a Super

Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to review current
invactar dataile and advice

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

28/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

28/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

28/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.
Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their

raaiiact

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

28/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Scanned 3 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

29/11/2022

0.20

$39.00

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

29/11/2022

$19.50

Scanned 3 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

2/12/2022

0.60

$117.00

Prepare letters to investors in relation to a request for a unit holding balance and a

change of authority. Access investor management database, search for investor and
nrint invactar halance

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

2/12/2022

0.30

$58.50

Prepare a letter to investor in relation to the timing of distributions from the Fund.

Access investor management database to review current details and draft letter for their
reaiiect

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

2/12/2022

0.10

$19.50

Scanned documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or post

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

6/12/2022

0.20

$39.00

Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

6/12/2022

1.30

$253.50

Reviewed returned email and record investor details in returned email register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

6/12/2022

1.00

$195.00

Reviewed returned email and record investor details in returned email register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

6/12/2022

0.50

$97.50

Reviewed returned email and record investor details in returned email register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR

Jay Brown

Undergraduate

Creditors

6/12/2022

0.40

$78.00

Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.
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BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 7/12/2022 1.00 $195.00[Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 7/12/2022 0.20 $39.00|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 7/12/2022 1.70 $331.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 7/12/2022 0.20 $39.00|Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracacc tn 1indata

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 7/12/2022 0.20 $39.00|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 7/12/2022 1.50 $292.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 8/12/2022 2.00 $390.00|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 8/12/2022 1.10 $214.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 8/12/2022 1.90 $370.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 12/12/2022 0.30 $58.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 12/12/2022 1.00 $195.00|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 12/12/2022 0.70 $136.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 12/12/2022 0.20 $39.00|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 12/12/2022 0.80 $156.00[Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 12/12/2022 0.30 $58.50|Prepare letter to executor of estate in response to their request to transfer units from a
deceased estate to the beneficiaries of the estate. Access investor management
databhace tn review current invector detaile and advice

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 12/12/2022 0.30 $58.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 13/12/2022 0.30 $58.50|Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a change of details request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
raniiact ac ner the Fiinde nalicwv

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 13/12/2022 1.30 $253.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 13/12/2022 0.40 $78.00|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 13/12/2022 0.10 $19.50|Scanned 3 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 16/12/2022 0.50 $97.50|Scanned 11 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents to required
investor via email or nost.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 16/12/2022 0.50 $97.50|Prepare a letter to investor in relation to a request for a unit holding balance. Access
investor management database, search for investor and print investor balance.

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 16/12/2022 0.70 $136.50|Prepare letter to investor in response to their request to transfer units and unit balance
from a Super Fund to their personal name. Access investor management database to
raview ciirrant invactar deataile and advice

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 16/12/2022 2.10 $409.50(Scanned and copied 72 documents and saved to files and database, sent off documents
to reauired investor via email or nost. (FauitiTrust return mail)

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 16/12/2022 0.40 $78.00|Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracecc tn 1indate

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 20/12/2022 0.20 $39.00|Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the

Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate
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BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 20/12/2022 0.90 $175.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 21/12/2022 0.50 $97.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 21/12/2022 0.70 $136.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 21/12/2022 0.40 $78.00|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 21/12/2022 0.70 $136.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 21/12/2022 2.20 $429.00|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 21/12/2022 0.50 $97.50|Reviewed returned mail and record investor details in returned mail register. Prepare
letter to reauest new address details

BR Jay Brown Undergraduate Creditors 23/12/2022 0.30 $58.50|Prepare letter to investor seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracacc tn 1indata

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 16/01/2023 0.60 $117.00|Prepare letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracecc tn 1indate

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 16/01/2023 0.90 $175.50|Prepare letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracacc tn 1indata

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 17/01/2023 1.00 $195.00(Prepare letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracecc tn 1indate

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 17/01/2023 0.80 $156.00(|Prepare letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nracacc tn 1indata

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 20/01/2023 0.30 $58.50(|Preparing correspondence to investors in relation to a change of details/transfer of
units/transfer of units of deceased estate request, as per RW instructions. And
siibmittina for annrowval

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 25/01/2023 1.00 $195.00|Preparing correspondence to investors in relation to a change of details/transfer of
units/transfer of units of deceased estate request, as per RW instructions. And
ciihmittina far annrowval

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 25/01/2023 1.30 $253.50(Preparing correspondence to investors in relation to a change of details/transfer of
units/transfer of units of deceased estate request, as per RW instructions. And
siibmittina for annrowval

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 30/01/2023 0.60 $117.00|Preparing email correspondence to investors in response to change of details and
confirmation of chanae reauests

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 30/01/2023 0.20 $39.00(|Preparing mail correspondence to investors in response to change of details and
confirmation of chanae reauests

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 2/02/2023 0.10 $19.50|Emailing correspondence to investors in relation to a change of details/transfer of
units/transfer of units of deceased estate request, as per RW instructions. And
ciihmittina far annrowval

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 6/02/2023 0.10 $19.50([Scanning in correspondence to investors in relation to a change of details/transfer of
units/transfer of units of deceased estate request, as per RW instructions. And
siibmittina for annrowval

BR Miah Clarke Undergraduate Creditors 6/02/2023 0.10 $19.50|Emailing correspondence to investors in relation to a change of details/transfer of
units/transfer of units of deceased estate request, as per RW instructions. And
ciihmittina far annrowval

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 5/07/2021 1.30 $825.50(|reviewed correspondence from borrower regarding proceedings against EL/potential
proceedings against the EIF and Receiver/reviewed previous correspondence/prepare
recnonce

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 9/07/2021 1.20 $762.00|reviewed correspondence with borrower regarding potential proceedings/reviewed prior
correspondence with borrower and including with EL liquidators

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 12/07/2021 0.20 $127.00(telephone call with our solicitors regarding correspondence received from borrower and

nronosed resnonse
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BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 29/07/2021 0.10 $63.50|reviewed BAS

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 21/09/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed invoices/authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 5/10/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed correspondence from ASIC regarding AFSL/prepared request to extend
suspension of AFSL

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 5/10/2021 0.10 $63.50|reviewed correspondence from ASIC regarding AFSL expert/sent response

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 7/10/2021 0.10 $63.50|authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 26/10/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed three BAS's

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 27/10/2021 0.10 $63.50|reviewed correspondence from ASIC regarding extension of AFSL/reviewed extension
document

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 24/11/2021 0.10 $63.50|authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 26/11/2021 0.10 $63.50|reviewed BAS

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 2/12/2021 1.40 $889.00|reviewed correspondence from defendants solicitors regarding proceedings brought by EL
liquidators and notice of non party disclosure/reviewed notice and documents subject to
tha natice/amail niir enlicitare reaardina came

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 8/12/2021 0.30 $190.50(reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding notice of non party disclosure in
respect of proceedings brought by the EL liquidators/prepared draft email to the EL
linnidatore/cant reenonce ta oinir enlicitare

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 14/12/2021 0.20 $127.00|reviewed invoices/authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 8/03/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed invoices/authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 8/03/2022 0.10 $65.50|reviewed two BAS's

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 12/04/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed invoices/authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 21/04/2022 1.10 $720.50|meeting with Ryan Whyte regarding preparation of accounts from June 2011 to
date/issues to be considered

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 27/04/2022 0.40 $262.00|reviewed Corporations Act regarding requirements for audited accounts/email C1/JP
reaardinag preparation of accounts

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 24/05/2022 0.10 $65.50|reviewed two BAS's

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 30/06/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed invoices/authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 30/06/2022 1.30 $851.50|reviewed file/outstanding issues

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 5/07/2022 0.10 $65.50|authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 12/07/2022 0.10 $65.50|authorised payment

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 19/07/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors regarding outstanding cost orders against
the FI liauidators/one amount aareed and other to be claimed

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 25/07/2022 0.10 $65.50(|reviewed invoice/authorised payment

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 3/08/2022 0.10 $65.50|reviewed correspondence regarding request for consent to two leases in relation to
borrower's propertv/sent resnonse

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 22/08/2022 0.10 $65.50|authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 30/08/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed May, June and July BAS

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 7/09/2022 0.10 $65.50|authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 28/09/2022 0.10 $65.50|reviewed BAS

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 1/11/2022 0.20 $131.00|reviewed invoices/authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 7/11/2022 0.70 $458.50|reviewed correspondence from EL liquidators and borrower's solicitors regarding release
of securitv/reviewed documentation relatina to loan

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 8/11/2022 0.30 $196.50|reviewed correspondence from ASIC regarding expiry of AFSL/drafted response
reaardina status of windinag un and reauest for extension of AFSI

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 5/12/2022 0.10 $65.50|authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 12/01/2023 0.10 $65.50|authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 12/01/2023 0.10 $65.50|reviewed BAS
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BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 27/01/2023 0.10 $65.50(|reviewed invoice/authorised payment

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 30/01/2023 0.10 $65.50|reviewed BAS

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 7/02/2023 0.10 $65.50|authorised payments

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 8/02/2023 0.10 $65.50|reviewed BAS

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 28/02/2023 0.30 $196.50|reviewed draft affidavit in relation to judicial advice application/provided instructions to
finalise

BR David Whyte Appointee Trade On 28/02/2023 0.20 $131.00|meeting with our solicitors regarding judicial advice application/swear affidavit in support
of anplication

BR David Whyte Partner Trade On 19/03/2023 0.20 $131.00(reviewed invoices/authorised payments

BR David Whyte Partner Trade On 11/04/2023 0.10 $65.50(|reviewed invoices/authorised payments

BR David Whyte Partner Trade On 20/04/2023 0.10 $65.50(|reviewed/approved BAS's

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Trade On 27/01/2022 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve supplier payments including website hosting invoice.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Trade On 8/03/2022 0.40 $212.00|Review and amend/approve 4x supplier payments.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 1/07/2021 1.20 $408.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and
winding up of the Fund. Review and respond to our solicitors queries regarding the
affidavits.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 1/07/2021 0.40 $136.00|Prepare email to the printing company to prepare a quote for mailing out all of the
material for the application for the winding up of the fund to include in the affidavit.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 1/07/2021 0.90 $306.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and
winding up of the Fund. Review and respond to our solicitors queries regarding the
affidavite

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 2/07/2021 1.70 $578.00(|Prepare the narrations for period 1 May 2021 to 30 June 2021 to add to David' affidavit
for remuneration approval

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 2/07/2021 1.40 $476.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and
winding up of the Fund. Review and respond to our solicitors queries regarding the
affidavits.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 2/07/2021 0.90 $306.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and
winding up of the Fund. Review and respond to our solicitors queries regarding the
affidavits.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/07/2021 0.80 $272.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and
winding up of the Fund. Review and respond to our solicitors queries regarding the
affidavits.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/07/2021 1.30 $442.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and
winding up of the Fund. Review and respond to our solicitors queries regarding the
affidavits.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/07/2021 1.10 $374.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and
winding up of the Fund. Review and respond to our solicitors queries regarding the
affidavits.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/07/2021 1.20 $408.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and
winding up of the Fund. Review and respond to our solicitors queries regarding the
affidavits.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/07/2021 1.40 $476.00|Review David's application and affidavits for the equalisation payment, remuneration and

winding up of the Fund. Determine the position of the final accounts and provide
comments to Jayden.
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

12/07/2021

0.30

$102.00

Meeting with our solicitors regarding finalising the application for the winding up of the
Fund

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

13/07/2021

1.40

$476.00

Review and update the finalising liabilities affidavit, update the equalisation payment

calculations to include no set off and review Linda Rickard's affidavit for any updates for
cot nff RE finalicatinn annlicatinn

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

14/07/2021

$510.00

Review and update the finalising liabilities affidavit, update the equalisation payment

calculations to include no set off and review Linda Rickard's affidavit for any updates for
sot off RF finalicatinn annlication

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

15/07/2021

$306.00

Determine the cost and how we will prepare the accounts for the EIF for the 10 periods

or for the final accounts. Provide Jayden Comments for the application of the finalisation
of the windina 1in nf the Fiind

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

19/07/2021

$374.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accannts of the FIF

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

19/07/2021

0.70

$238.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accniinte nf the FTE

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

20/07/2021

0.70

$238.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accannts of the FIF

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

20/07/2021

1.00

$340.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accniinte nf the FTE

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

21/07/2021

1.40

$476.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accannts of the FIE Accecs MYOR ta exnart renorts

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

22/07/2021

0.80

$272.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accniinte af the ETE _Accace MYOR tn avnart renarte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

22/07/2021

0.70

$238.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accannts of the FIE Accecs MYOR ta exnaort renorts

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

22/07/2021

$510.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accniinte af the ETE _Accace MYOR tn avnart renarte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

23/07/2021

$204.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accannts of the FIE Accecs MYOR ta exnart renaorts

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

23/07/2021

$170.00

Review the EIF records to locate the last accounts prepared and finalised and also the

draft accounts for the year ended 30 June 2011 in order to consider how we prepare the
final accniinte af the ETE _Accace MYOR tn avnart renarte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/07/2021

0.80

$272.00

Prepare the final drafts of the multiple affidavits and application for the application for
the equalisation payment, remuneration, final distribution and winding up of the Fund.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/07/2021

0.60

$204.00

Prepare the final drafts of the multiple affidavits and application for the application for

the equalisation payment, remuneration, final distribution and winding up of the Fund.
Dicriice with lavden Caiiletan

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/07/2021

1.00

$340.00

Prepare the final drafts of the multiple affidavits and application for the application for

the equalisation payment, remuneration, final distribution and winding up of the Fund.
Dicriice with 1avden Caiileton

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

2/08/2021

0.30

$102.00

Request quote for the mail out of the auditors' report and final accounts to be included in
the application for the windina up of the Fund

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

3/08/2021

$170.00

Prepare email to our solicitors regarding the quotes obtained for the mail out to be
included in David's affidavits in support of the finalisation anolication

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

4/08/2021

0.40

$136.00

telephone call with Jayden Coulston regarding equalisation payment
calculations/finalisation of affidavit reaarding same

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

4/08/2021

0.40

$136.00

Review the final drafts of David Whyte's affidavits and application documents for the
finalisation application. Update where necessary and provide comments to Jayden.
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BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/08/2021 0.40 $136.00[telephone call with Jayden Coulston regarding equalisation payment affidavit for the
finalisation application

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/08/2021 0.60 $204.00|Review the final drafts of David Whyte's affidavits and application documents for the
finalisation application. Update where necessary and provide comments to Jayden.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/08/2021 1.20 $408.00[Review the final drafts of David Whyte's affidavits and application documents for the
finalisation application. Update where necessary and provide comments to Jayden.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/08/2021 0.90 $306.00[Calculate the hardship payment members as per David Whyte's comments to enter into
the eaualisation pavment affidavit for the finalisation apolication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/08/2021 1.60 $544.00[Calculate the hardship payment members as per David Whyte's comments to enter into
the eaualisation pavment affidavit for the finalisation apoplication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/08/2021 0.20 $68.00]|telephone call with Jayden Coulston and David Whyte regarding equalisation payment
calculations/finalisation of affidavit reaarding same

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/08/2021 0.70 $238.00[Calculate the hardship payment members as per David Whyte's comments to enter into
the eaualisation pavment affidavit for the finalisation apoplication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/08/2021 1.60 $544.00[Calculate the hardship payment members as per David Whyte's comments to enter into
the eaualisation pavment affidavit for the finalisation apolication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/08/2021 0.20 $68.00]|telephone call with Jayden Coulston and David Whyte regarding equalisation payment
calculations/finalisation of affidavit reaarding same

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/08/2021 0.60 $204.00[Calculate the hardship payment members as per David Whyte's comments to enter into
the eaualisation pavment affidavit for the finalisation apolication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/08/2021 0.90 $306.00[Calculate the hardship payment members as per David Whyte's comments to enter into
the eaualisation pavment affidavit for the finalisation apolication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/08/2021 0.60 $204.00|Telecon with Jayden Coulston regarding the material for the finalisation application and
where undates are reauired

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/08/2021 0.40 $136.00|Telecon with Jayden Coulston regarding the material for the finalisation application and
where undates are reauired

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/08/2021 0.20 $68.00(|Telecon with Jayden Coulston regarding the material for the finalisation application and
where undates are reauired

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/08/2021 0.10 $34.00|Telecon with Jayden Coulston regarding the material for the finalisation application and
where undates are reauired

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/08/2021 0.50 $170.00|Update the draft affidavits and application as per Jayden's comments for the hardship
eaualisation pavment amendments. RFE finalisation application

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/08/2021 1.00 $340.00|Update the draft affidavits and application as per Jayden's comments for the hardship
eaualisation pavment amendments. RFE finalisation application

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/08/2021 0.20 $68.00|Update the draft affidavits and application as per Jayden's comments for the hardship
eaualisation pavment amendments. RFE finalisation abplication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/08/2021 0.80 $272.00|Update the draft affidavits and application as per Jayden's comments for the hardship
eaualisation pavment amendments. RFE finalisation application

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 9/08/2021 0.50 $170.00|Update the draft affidavits and application as per Jayden's comments for the hardship
eaualisation pavment amendments. RFE finalisation abplication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 9/08/2021 0.40 $136.00|Meeting with David & Jayden regarding finalising the material for the finalisation
apnplication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 9/08/2021 0.30 $102.00|Update the draft affidavits and application as per Jayden's comments for the hardship
eaualisation pavment amendments. RFE finalisation abplication

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/09/2021 0.30 $102.00|Prepare email to the email company for the mail out of the notice for the application of
the final distribution, equalisation payment, liquidators fees & expenses and winding up
of the Fiind

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/09/2021 0.30 $102.00|Prepare email to arrange for the notice to be put in the newspapers for the application of
the final distribution, equalisation payment, liquidators fees & expenses and winding up
of the Eiind

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/09/2021 0.30 $102.00|Prepare email to the printing company for the mail out of the notice for the application of
the final distribution, equalisation payment, liquidators fees & expenses and winding up
of the Fiind

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/09/2021 0.30 $102.00[Prepare email to the IT consultant to upload the notice & court documents for the

application of the final distribution, equalisation payment, liquidators fees & expenses
and windina 1in of the Fiind
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

6/09/2021

$374.00

Export and prepare the mailing list for the mail out of the notice for the application of the

final distribution, equalisation payment, liquidators fees & expenses and winding up of
the Fiind

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

7/09/2021

0.40

$136.00

Send the notice via email to the investors for the application of the final distribution,
equalisation payment, liquidators fees & expenses and winding up of the Fund.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

9/09/2021

1.00

$340.00

Collate all of the information for the service on members of the notice for the application
of the final distribution, equalisation payment, liquidators fees & expenses and winding
up of the Fund to provide to our solicitors for my affidavit for service.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

15/09/2021

0.30

$102.00

Review and update my affidavit for the service on members for the notice of the
finalisation matters to wind up the Fund

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

16/09/2021

0.40

$136.00

Attend our solicitors office to swear my affidavit for the service on members for the
notice of the finalisation matters to wind up the Fund

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

1/10/2021

0.20

$68.00

Attend our solicitors office to swear an affidavit regarding investor responses to the
notice of the aoplication for the windina up of the Fund

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/10/2021

0.60

$204.00

Locate the draft 30 June 2011 accounts prepared by Equititrust to provide to David in
preparation of preparing the accounts for all periods after our appointment.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

5/11/2021

$374.00

Prepare mailing list as per Court orders to provide to the liquidators to notify investors
reaardina their claim for remuneration and exnenses from the FIF.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

8/11/2021

$612.00

Review the draft financials of the EIF for 30 June 2011 to check against the records to

determine if any amendments are required prior to us finalising the accounts and
nrenarina the fiirther vear financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

9/11/2021

$170.00

Review the draft financials of the EIF for 30 June 2011 to check against the records to

determine if any amendments are required prior to us finalising the accounts and
nranarina the fiirthar vear financiale

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

18/11/2021

$374.00

Locate and export all information for the draft 30 June 2011 accounts in order to check

them for preparing the 30 June 2011 and onward accounts. Review the information for
acciiracvy anainet the draft acconinte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

19/11/2021

$612.00

Locate and export all information for the draft 30 June 2011 accounts in order to check

them for preparing the 30 June 2011 and onward accounts. Review the information for
acciiracvy anainct tha draft accaninte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

19/11/2021

$374.00

Locate and export all information for the draft 30 June 2011 accounts in order to check

them for preparing the 30 June 2011 and onward accounts. Review the information for
acciiracvy anainet the draft acconinte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

19/11/2021

0.30

$102.00

Locate and export all information for the draft 30 June 2011 accounts in order to check

them for preparing the 30 June 2011 and onward accounts. Review the information for
acciiracvy anainct tha draft accaninte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

19/11/2021

0.90

$306.00

Locate and export all information for the draft 30 June 2011 accounts in order to check

them for preparing the 30 June 2011 and onward accounts. Review the information for
acciiracvy anainet the draft acconinte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

19/11/2021

$170.00

Locate and export all information for the draft 30 June 2011 accounts in order to check

them for preparing the 30 June 2011 and onward accounts. Review the information for
acciiracvy anainct tha draft accaninte

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

18/03/2022

$390.00

Continue preparing template to prepare the financial accounts for each audit period from
2011 to date.

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

6/04/2022

$585.00

Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the neriod ended 30 Tune 2021

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

6/04/2022

$195.00

Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the neriod ended 30 Tune 2021

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

6/04/2022

0.60

$234.00

Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the neriod ended 30 Tune 2021

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

7/04/2022

1.70

$663.00

Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the neriod ended 30 Tune 2021

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

7/04/2022

1.40

$546.00

Export information from the investor database and MYOB to prepare the financials for the
neriod ended 30 lune 2011 to the neriod ended 30 Tune 2021

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

8/04/2022

1.70

$663.00

Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the neriod ended 30 Tune 2021
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BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 11/04/2022 2.20 $858.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 11/04/2022 0.90 $351.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 19/04/2022 0.50 $195.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 20/04/2022 0.80 $312.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 20/04/2022 1.50 $585.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 21/04/2022 1.10 $429.00|meeting with David Whyte regarding preparation of accounts from June 2011 to
date/issues to be considered

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 21/04/2022 0.80 $312.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 21/04/2022 1.80 $702.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 21/04/2022 1.10 $429.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 21/04/2022 1.30 $507.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 22/04/2022 0.50 $195.00|Prepare financial statements template to prepare the financials for the period ended 30
June 2011 to the period ended 30 June 2021

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 29/04/2022 1.00 $390.00|Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 29/04/2022 0.80 $312.00|Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 29/04/2022 0.20 $78.00|Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 29/04/2022 2.40 $936.00(Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/05/2022 1.10 $429.00|Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 9/05/2022 1.70 $663.00|Prepare the 37th update report to creditors, update legal matters, prepare receipts and
navments and estimated retiirn.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 12/05/2022 1.40 $546.00|Prepare the 37th update report to creditors, update legal matters, prepare receipts and
navments and estimated retiirn.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 12/05/2022 1.60 $624.00|Prepare the 37th update report to creditors, update legal matters, prepare receipts and
navments and estimated retiirn.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 13/05/2022 0.90 $351.00|Prepare the 37th update report to creditors, update legal matters, prepare receipts and
navments and estimated retiirn.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 13/05/2022 1.50 $585.00(Prepare the 37th update report to creditors, update legal matters, prepare receipts and
navments and estimated retiirn.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 13/05/2022 1.00 $390.00(Prepare the 37th update report to creditors, update legal matters, prepare receipts and
navments and estimated retiirn.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 13/05/2022 0.20 $78.00|Prepare the 37th update report to creditors, update legal matters, prepare receipts and
navments and estimated retiirn.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 26/05/2022 0.40 $156.00(Prepare spreadsheet for the financial accounts ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 26/05/2022 1.40 $546.00(|Prepare spreadsheet for the financial accounts ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 27/05/2022 0.70 $273.00|Prepare spreadsheet for the financial accounts ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 27/05/2022 0.20 $78.00|Prepare spreadsheet for the financial accounts ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

20/06/2022

1.60

$624.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

20/06/2022

1.20

$468.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

20/06/2022

$819.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

21/06/2022

0.90

$351.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

21/06/2022

1.70

$663.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

21/06/2022

0.80

$312.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

21/06/2022

$585.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

21/06/2022

1.20

$468.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

22/06/2022

1.60

$624.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

22/06/2022

0.90

$351.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

22/06/2022

1.20

$468.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

22/06/2022

2.20

$858.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

23/06/2022

2.90

$1,131.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

23/06/2022

$195.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials
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BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

23/06/2022

1.70

$663.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

23/06/2022

1.70

$663.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

23/06/2022

0.70

$273.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

24/06/2022

0.80

$312.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

24/06/2022

1.80

$702.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/06/2022

$585.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/06/2022

0.60

$234.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/06/2022

0.80

$312.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/06/2022

0.90

$351.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

27/06/2022

1.30

$507.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

28/06/2022

$195.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

29/06/2022

$975.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

29/06/2022

0.40

$156.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR

Ryan Whyte

Senior Analyst

Trade On

30/06/2022

0.20

$78.00

Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials
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BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 30/06/2022 1.80 $702.00|Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 30/06/2022 1.00 $390.00|Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 30/06/2022 2.10 $819.00|Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 30/06/2022 0.60 $234.00|Cont. Preparing the financial accounts for each audit period for 30 June 2011 to 30 June
2021 including preparing adjustments, impairments of the loans, accruals, investor units
and other transactions. Locate and review documents to support the financials

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/07/2022 1.30 $507.00|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 5/07/2022 1.80 $702.00(|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/07/2022 0.60 $234.00|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 6/07/2022 1.30 $507.00(|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 7/07/2022 1.80 $702.00|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 7/07/2022 0.80 $312.00(|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 8/07/2022 1.00 $390.00|Update 37th report to investors for outstanding matters and estimated return and
receints & navments as at 30 June 2022

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 8/07/2022 0.40 $156.00|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 13/07/2022 1.90 $741.00|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 13/07/2022 0.30 $117.00|Prepare the financial accounts for the years ended 30 June 2011 to 30 June 2022.
Prepare impairments, trial balance, balance sheet, accruals, p&l, cashflows and notes.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 18/07/2022 0.50 $195.00|{Update the 37th report to creditors as per David's comments.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 18/07/2022 1.60 $624.00|Export the mailing list, prepare and sort the mailing list to send the report to investors
dated 18 lulv 2022 to investors via email and nost.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 18/07/2022 1.00 $390.00(|Arrange for the 37th report to investors to be posted to the website, sent via email and
nosted.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 17/08/2022 1.20 $468.00[Review previous financials and other documentation. Prepare the opening balances for
the financial accounts for the neriod endina 30 Tune 2023,

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 17/08/2022 1.30 $507.00[Review previous financials and other documentation. Prepare the opening balances for
the financial accounts for the neriod endina 30 Tune 2023,

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 17/08/2022 0.60 $234.00[Review previous financials and other documentation. Prepare the opening balances for
the financial accounts for the neriod endina 30 Tune 2023,

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 18/08/2022 1.80 $702.00[Review previous financials and other documentation. Prepare the opening balances for

the financial accounts for the neriod endina 30 lune 2023,
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BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 19/08/2022 1.50 $585.00[Review previous financials and other documentation. Prepare the opening balances for
the financial accounts for the period endinag 30 June 2023

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/11/2022 1.60 $624.00|Export transfer listing from July 2021 to November 2022. Use information to update the
equalisation payment spreadsheet to reflect the new parties for payment at the end of
tha racsivarchin

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/11/2022 1.70 $663.00|Export transfer listing from July 2021 to November 2022. Use information to update the
equalisation payment spreadsheet to reflect the new parties for payment at the end of
the receiverchin

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/11/2022 1.10 $429.00|Export transfer listing from July 2021 to November 2022. Use information to update the
equalisation payment spreadsheet to reflect the new parties for payment at the end of
tha racsivarchin

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 4/11/2022 1.90 $741.00|Export transfer listing from July 2021 to November 2022. Use information to update the
equalisation payment spreadsheet to reflect the new parties for payment at the end of
the receiverchin

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 7/11/2022 1.00 $390.00|Export transfer listing from July 2021 to November 2022. Use information to update the
equalisation payment spreadsheet to reflect the new parties for payment at the end of
tha racsivarchin

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 9/11/2022 0.70 $273.00|Export transfer listing from July 2021 to November 2022. Use information to update the
equalisation payment spreadsheet to reflect the new parties for payment at the end of
the receiverchin

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 9/11/2022 0.40 $156.00|Export transfer listing from July 2021 to November 2022. Use information to update the
equalisation payment spreadsheet to reflect the new parties for payment at the end of
tha racsivarchin

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 8/02/2023 1.00 $390.00(Prepare estimated return to 31 Jan 23 for David's affidavit.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 8/02/2023 1.20 $468.00|Review narrations to identify time spent on the EL liquidators claim

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 20/03/2023 2.10 $819.00|Export narrations, review and summarise with all other annexures for David's affidavit
for the finalisation annlication.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 21/03/2023 1.50 $585.00|Export narrations, review and summarise with all other annexures for David's affidavit
for the finalisation annlication.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 11/04/2023 1.60 $624.00|Review and update the affidavits for the winding up application amendment. Update
eaualisation navment snreadsheet and nrenare the estimated return.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 11/04/2023 2.30 $897.00[Review and update the affidavits for the winding up application amendment. Update
eaualisation navment snreadsheet and nrenare the estimated return.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 11/04/2023 1.50 $585.00(Prepare 38th report to investors including estimated return, receipts and payments and
claims.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 13/04/2023 1.40 $546.00|Update estimated return and affidavits for the winding up application amendment

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 14/04/2023 1.20 $468.00(Prepare 38th report to investors including estimated return, receipts and payments and
claims.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Trade On 20/04/2023 1.00 $390.00[Review amended application and equalisation payment figures to determine how the
equalisation payment can be processed in the Fund's database. Prepare email to intersoft
tn determine how to nrocecc

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 31/03/2022 0.30 $72.00|Preparing payment to finPOWER for monthly license fee.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 29/04/2022 0.30 $72.00|Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 29/04/2022 0.70 $168.00(|Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 29/04/2022 0.30 $72.00|Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 29/04/2022 2.70 $648.00(|Locate and review valuations for the properties held for each borrower of the EIF for
support in preparing the impairments for the financial accounts from FY2011 to FY2021.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 7/07/2022 0.70 $168.00|Building asset impairments master spreadsheet for purposes of financial accounts for

impairments of the loans
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BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 7/07/2022 1.00 $240.00(Building asset impairments master spreadsheet for purposes of financial accounts for
impairments of the loans

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 11/07/2022 0.90 $216.00(Building asset impairments master spreadsheet for purposes of management accounts
for uncomina FTF report to investors

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 11/07/2022 0.50 $120.00|Building asset impairments master spreadsheet for purposes of financial accounts for
impairments of the loans

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Trade On 12/07/2022 0.90 $216.00(Building asset impairments master spreadsheet for purposes of management accounts
for uncomina FIF report to investors

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 2/07/2021 1.10 $698.50|reviewed annexures for remuneration application/timesheet narrations for May and June
2021

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 5/07/2021 0.30 $190.50][telephone call with Jayden Coulston regarding queries on draft affidavit relating to
eaualisation pavments

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 5/07/2021 0.20 $127.00[telephone call with our solicitors regarding applications to court to finalise
administration/availabilitv of counsel/finalisation of material

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 5/07/2021 0.60 $381.00|reviewed draft affidavit and previous correspondence regarding equalisation
pavment/hardshin navments/transfers nost anbointment

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 7/07/2021 0.80 $508.00|reviewed updates to three affidavits to finalise administration/reviewed terms of hardship
pavment relief/reviewed draft undate to our solicitors

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 4/08/2021 0.20 $127.00[telephone call with Jayden Coulston and Ryan Whyte regarding equalisation payment
calculations/finalisation of affidavit reaarding same

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 4/08/2021 1.60 $1,016.00|reviewed four affidavits and two applications in relation to finalising the receivership

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 4/08/2021 0.50 $317.50|reviewed affidavit regarding equalisation payment and finalisation of receivership

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 5/08/2021 0.20 $127.00[telephone call with JC and RW regarding equalisation payment calculations in respect of
hardship redemptions

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 9/08/2021 0.70 $444.50][telephone call with Jayden Coulston and Ryan Whyte regarding draft affidavits to support
court applications to finalise administration/obtain remuneration
annraval/raviewad/finalicad affidavite and raviewad draft email ta anr enlicitare

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 13/08/2021 0.70 $444.50|attended our solicitors offices, reviewed and executed three affidavits regarding
finalisation of receivershin and eaualisation havment

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 30/08/2021 0.20 $127.00(|reviewed correspondence from our solicitors and EL liquidators solicitors regarding
indemnitv annlication and nronosed orders/reviewed draft resnonse

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 30/08/2021 0.20 $127.00(|reviewed submissions in relation to application to substituted service and to finalise the
administration

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 29/09/2021 0.10 $63.50(|reviewed draft affidavit in relation to court application for remuneration approval

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 17/02/2022 0.20 $131.00(|reviewed ASIC annual return form 5602

BR David Whyte Appointee Administration 7/02/2023 0.10 $65.50|reviewed ASIC annual return form 5602

BR David Whyte Partner Administration 19/03/2023 3.70 $2,423.50|reviewed timesheet narrations for the period 1 July 2021 to 28 February 2023 for
remuneration annlication/finalisation annlication

BR David Whyte Partner Administration 11/04/2023 0.90 $589.50(|reviewed amended application regarding finalisation/reviewed supporting affidavits in
resnect of eaualisation navment and remuneration

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 1/07/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review email regarding affidavit and court

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 27/07/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review June BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 28/07/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review affidavit material

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 3/08/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review correspondence to bank

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 26/08/2021 0.20 $108.00[Review seven changes of details requests and correspondence to investors

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 31/08/2021 0.10 $54.00(|Three letters to investors with unit balance updates and change of details

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 1/09/2021 0.20 $108.00[Review email from lawyer and next steps re notice and lodgements
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BR Charles Haines Director Administration 6/09/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review email from lawyers re proceedings

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 17/09/2021 0.20 $108.00|Review and approve 6 payments to creditors

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 18/10/2021 0.10 $54.00(three change of details letters

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 22/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review August BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 22/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review July BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 26/10/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review September BAS and associated workpapers

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 1/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review and authorise finPOWER payment

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 15/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|Review correspondence from solicitors regarding proceedings

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 23/11/2021 0.10 $54.00|October BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 11/01/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review November BAS and associated refund calcs

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 24/05/2022 0.20 $111.00|Review March and April BAS and workpapers

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 25/05/2022 0.10 $55.50|{Review and approve Feb BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 29/06/2022 0.20 $111.00|Review and approve 5 payments to solicitors and service providers

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 5/07/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and authorise payment to Gadens

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 7/07/2022 0.20 $111.00(4 letters to investors regarding unit balance updates and general updates

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 12/08/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and authorise payment to Gadens for legal fees

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 16/08/2022 0.10 $55.50[Two letters to investors regarding updates and additional information required to update
account holdinas

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 19/08/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve payment of finPOWER costs

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 29/08/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review May BAS and associated workpapers

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 29/08/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review June BAS and associated workpapers

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 29/08/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review July BAS and associated workpapers

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 7/09/2022 0.30 $166.50|Update staff regarding proposed settlement arrangements and strategy regarding final
dividend, accounts, court application and process for dealing with unclaimed funds of
final dictrihutinn

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 27/09/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve August BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 30/09/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve accounts payable payment

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 27/10/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve legal fees

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 28/10/2022 0.10 $55.50|Account payments and reconciliation

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 28/10/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review update on payments of receivership expenses

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 31/10/2022 0.10 $55.50|Update regarding deed of settlement and response from Hall Chadwick

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 1/11/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve payment
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BR Charles Haines Director Administration 1/11/2022 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve solicitors payment

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 12/01/2023 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve Nov BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 12/01/2023 0.20 $111.00|Review and authorise batch payment of expenses

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 27/01/2023 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve payment

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 30/01/2023 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve Dec BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 31/01/2023 0.10 $55.50|review and approve payment of it costs

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 31/01/2023 0.10 $55.50(|review multiple treasury payments

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 7/02/2023 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve payment of legal fees

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 7/02/2023 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 2/03/2023 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve payment for IT costs

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 31/03/2023 0.10 $55.50|Review and approve payment of IT costs

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 4/04/2023 0.10 $55.50|Review and authorise payment of legal costs associated with administration

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 18/04/2023 0.10 $54.00|Review and approve February BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 18/04/2023 0.10 $54.00|Review and approve March BAS

BR Charles Haines Director Administration 20/04/2023 0.10 $54.00|update staff regarding statutory lodgements

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Administration 20/07/2021 0.70 $360.50|T/c Julia Pagcu re preparation of financial statements for duration of Receivership and
process/timing to be undertaken for same. Update David Whyte re same. Liaise with
Rvan Whute tn cammence nullina data fram MYOR

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Administration 26/10/2021 0.10 $51.50|Instructions re preparation of annual accounts

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Administration 8/03/2022 0.30 $159.00[Review and approve 2x BAS lodgements and calculations.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Administration 7/04/2022 0.20 $106.00|{Review and approve 5x supplier payments.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Administration 15/03/2023 0.30 $159.00|Review settlement deed to confirm settlement sum in relation to claim by liquidators,
legal correspondence and drafted payment to Gadens Trust Account. Liaise with RW re
cnecific aleries and amendments tn navment

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Administration 15/03/2023 0.20 $106.00|Review and approve payment of supplier invoices including legal and IT fees.

BR Jayden Coulston Senior Manager Administration 17/03/2023 0.10 $53.00|Review and approve supplier payments.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Administration 14/07/2021 0.30 $85.50|Prepare payment of Gadens invoice. Review disbursements supporting documents in

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Administration 30/07/2021 0.20 $57.00 ;Dnr\églgie payment of FinPOWER invoice

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Administration 17/08/2021 0.30 $85.50|Prepare payment of Gadens invoice for July.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Administration 1/09/2021 1.20 $342.00|Prepare payments for 2 FinPOWER invoices, 2 Gadens invoices and Cyberthread.
Reconcile account

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Administration 3/09/2021 0.20 $57.00|Call from an investor seeking an update on the winding up of the fund.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Administration 14/09/2021 0.20 $57.00|Prepare payment of Gadens fees in MYOB and NAB

86




BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Administration 17/09/2021 0.20 $57.00|Prepare FinPOWER payment and forward to David Whyte for approval.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Administration 17/09/2021 0.60 $171.00|Prepare email to David Whyte linking all outstanding payments for approval.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Administration 21/09/2021 0.20 $57.00|Prepare payment to Cyberthread. Email to David Whyte for approval.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Administration 29/09/2021 0.30 $85.50|Reconcile bank account. File recent payments in records.

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Administration 1/12/2021 0.30 $85.50|Prepare Gadens payment in MYOB and NAB. Send to CH and JC via email and print and

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Administration 8/03/2022 0.30 $105.00 B?anftogslll;‘i?IIPOWER payments

BR Jordan Devery Senior Analyst Administration 26/05/2022 0.20 $70.00|Review of correspondence from investors in relation to a transfer of units request.
Prepare internal control forms to verify sufficient documentation provided to process
reauect ac ner the Fuind's nalicy

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 27/07/2021 0.20 $68.00|Review the June BAS and provide to Charles for approval.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 16/09/2021 0.20 $68.00|Review the BAS's for July & August 2021.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 29/09/2021 0.20 $68.00|Draft email to ASIC regarding assets held in the Fund as at 30 June 2021.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 5/10/2021 0.40 $136.00|Prepare two payments in MYOB & online banking.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 26/10/2021 0.20 $68.00|Review September BAS and provide to Charles for approval.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 1/11/2021 0.20 $68.00|Prepare payment of invoice in MYOB and online banking.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 9/11/2021 0.20 $68.00|Prepare payment of legal fees in MYOB and online banking

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 22/11/2021 0.20 $68.00|Review the BAS for October and provide to Charles.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 23/11/2021 0.20 $68.00|Prepare payment of invoice in MYOB & online banking.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 23/12/2021 0.20 $68.00|Prepare payment of invoice for IT expenses

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 10/01/2022 0.20 $78.00|Prepare payment of IT expenses in MYOB and online banking.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 11/01/2022 0.20 $78.00|Review November 2021 BAS prepared by Sarah and send to Charles for review.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 2/02/2022 0.20 $78.00|Prepare payment for legal fees on NAB and MYOB

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 4/02/2022 0.60 $234.00|Prepare summary of narrations

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 17/02/2022 0.50 $195.00[Review form 5602 prepared by Sarah and add details.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 17/02/2022 0.40 $156.00[Review form 5602 prepared by Sarah and add details.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 1/03/2022 0.40 $156.00[Prepare payments of invoices in MYOB and NAB.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 21/03/2022 0.20 $78.00|Prepare payment of IT expenses in MYOB and NAB

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 31/03/2022 0.20 $78.00|Review February BAS

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 5/04/2022 0.30 $117.00[{Review payments for IT and Legal fees prepared by Nigel and send to Jayden/Charles for

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 7/04/2022 0.60 $234.00 I?:ggg;lglbayment of multiple invoices and send to Jayden for approval

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 29/04/2022 0.20 $78.00|Prepare payment in INSOL and NAB for IT expenses
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BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 8/06/2022 0.30 $117.00|Prepare payment of IT expenses in INSOL and NAB

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 28/06/2022 0.20 $78.00|Prepare payment for IT expenses in INSOL6 and online banking.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 30/06/2022 0.20 $78.00|Prepare payment for IT expenses in INSOL and online banking

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 5/07/2022 0.20 $78.00|Prepare payment of invoice in INSOL6 and online banking for legal fees

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 8/08/2022 0.20 $78.00|Review BAS for May and June 2022, send to Charles for approval.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 29/08/2022 0.20 $78.00|Review July BAS and provide to Charles for review.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 31/08/2022 0.20 $78.00|Prepare payment of IT expenses in INSOL6 & online banking.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 6/09/2022 0.20 $78.00|Prepare payment of legal fees in INSOL6 and online banking

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 27/09/2022 0.20 $78.00|Review August 2022 BAS

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 10/01/2023 0.20 $78.00|Review November BAS and provide to Charles for review.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 24/01/2023 0.40 $156.00|Review and update 5602.

BR Ryan Whyte Senior Analyst Administration 7/02/2023 0.20 $78.00|Review December BAS

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 4/05/2022 0.30 $72.00|Preparing payment to Gadens for legal fees for month of April.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 4/05/2022 0.10 $24.00|Preparing payment to Gadens for legal fees for month of April.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 12/05/2022 0.40 $96.00|Preparing payment to Nexon for annual website license fee in MYOB and NAB. Sent
supportina docs to RW for review

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 21/07/2022 0.60 $144.00|Followed up voicemail from NAB's KYC verification department requesting urgent
verification for the Receiver's bank account. Prepared email to appointee contextualising
nhana call and renniectina that thav fallow 1in tha accannt

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 23/08/2022 0.10 $29.50|Review of unread emails sent to the Fund's mailbox. Print email for letter response to be
updated in the Fund's database. Review and update investor correspondence register
accordingly.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 1/11/2022 0.40 $118.00(|Prepared payment in Insol and NAB for finPOWER license fee for October month. Sent
RW for review.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 1/11/2022 0.30 $88.50|Prepared payment to Gadens for solicitors fees during October. Documents saved to file
and sent to RW for review.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 30/11/2022 0.10 $29.50(|Prepared payment in NAB and Insol for monthly license fee to finPOWER. Sent to RW for
review.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 30/11/2022 0.10 $29.50|Scanned signed prepared payment and saved to file to forward to DW for partner
annroval.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 30/11/2022 0.30 $88.50|Prepared payment in NAB and Insol for monthly license fee to finPOWER. Sent to RW for
review.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 2/12/2022 0.10 $29.50|Prepared payment to solicitors for monthly legal bill. Requisitions and invoice sent to RW
for review.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 2/12/2022 0.30 $88.50|Prepared payment to solicitors for monthly legal bill. Requisitions and invoice sent to RW
for review.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 10/01/2023 0.50 $147.50|Prepared payment of legal fees and monthly license fee for Investor server.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 25/01/2023 0.30 $88.50|Prepared payment to IT service provider for domain registration & hosting.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 31/01/2023 0.20 $59.00|Prepared payment of IT license fee for investor maintenance server.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 7/02/2023 0.20 $59.00|Prepared payment of outstanding invoice to Nexon for IT license fee and maintenance.
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BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 7/02/2023 0.20 $59.00|Prepared payment of solicitor's invoice.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 9/02/2023 0.10 $29.50|Reviewed BAS calculations by SC for January 2023.

BR Nigel Wenck Analyst Administration 14/04/2023 0.20 $59.00|Reviewed BASs for current quarter and sent to CH for approval.

BR Georgia Frank Graduate Analyst Administration 1/03/2023 0.20 $48.00|Created a new invoice for finPOWER Australia on insol 6. Paid supplier in Insol 6 and sent
to Charles for sian off

BR Georgia Frank Graduate Analyst Administration 2/03/2023 0.20 $48.00|Arrange payment for Gadens Invoice Account period: 27 January 2023 to 28 February
2023"

BR Georgia Frank Graduate Analyst Administration 16/03/2023 0.20 $48.00|Draft Accounts receivable payment, Nexon Pty Ltd on insol. Attached invoice and sent to
manaaer for approval

BR Georgia Frank Graduate Analyst Administration 21/03/2023 0.30 $72.00|Saved all invoices from 31 July 2021 to 28 Feb 2023 to file from APS

BR Georgia Frank Graduate Analyst Administration 31/03/2023 0.20 $48.00|Created an accounts payable in insol for finPOWER monthly subscription. Allocated to
supplier pavment and sent to manaaer for review

BR Jason Morcom Graduate Analyst Administration 15/02/2023 3.00 $720.00|Prepare 15 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR Jason Morcom Graduate Analyst Administration 16/02/2023 1.50 $360.00(Prepare 7 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR Jason Morcom Graduate Analyst Administration 16/02/2023 3.00 $720.00|Prepare 15 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocecc tn 1indate

BR Jason Morcom Graduate Analyst Administration 17/02/2023 2.00 $480.00(Prepare 10 letters to investors seeking to update the details for their investment with the
Fund. Access investor management database to review current details and advise
nrocess tn 1indate

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 1/07/2021 0.10 $23.00|Reconciling account 30 June

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 2/07/2021 0.30 $69.00|Lodging BAS period multiple periods. Saving to file, recording in Insol

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 23/07/2021 0.50 $115.00|Draft / review BAS June Qtr. Collating support docs and sending for approval.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 15/09/2021 0.20 $46.00|Draft BAS / review August and July Qtr. Collating and sending for approval.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 15/09/2021 0.30 $69.00|Draft BAS / review August and July Qtr. Collating and sending for approval.

BR Sarah Cunningham |Accounting Assistant |Administration 20/09/2021 0.20 $46.00|Review lodgement of Feb, March, April, June BAS.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 1/10/2021 0.10 $23.00|Reconciling acct 30 Sept.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 22/10/2021 0.20 $46.00|Review / draft Sept BAS. Collate support docs and send for approval.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 17/11/2021 0.20 $46.00|Draft, review BAS calculations. Complete BAS and collate with support docs. Send for
review

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 26/11/2021 0.10 $23.00|Oct 2021 BAS lodgement. Saving to file and updating Insol.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 7/12/2021 0.20 $46.00|Advise ATO lodgement of BAS in relation to query of outstanding lodgements.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 22/12/2021 0.30 $69.00|Review / draft BAS November. Collate support docs and send for approval.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 25/01/2022 0.10 $24.00|Lodging Nov BAS. Saving to file and updating Insol.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 16/02/2022 0.30 $72.00|Review 5602 details from Insol. Update request for info and send for review.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 17/02/2022 1.20 $288.00|Drafting ASIC form 5602 AAR. Manual draft and collating of RP detailed and summary.
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BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 21/02/2022 0.30 $72.00|Reconciling account. Drafting BAS Dec Qtr. Review, collating info and sending for

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 8/03/2022 0.20 $48.00 igggévg,IAS Jan and Dec on portal. Save to file and update Insol.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 31/03/2022 0.30 $72.00|Review / manual update BAS Feb 2022. Collating support docs and sending for approval.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 1/04/2022 0.10 $24.00|Reconciling account 31 March.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 6/04/2022 0.20 $48.00|Run BAS calculations / review. Complete form. Collate and send for review / approval.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 18/05/2022 0.30 $72.00|Drafting April BAS. Review, collate support info and send for approval.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 24/05/2022 0.10 $24.00|Lodging April and March BAS. Save to file. Update Insol

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 27/05/2022 0.20 $48.00|Lodging Feb 2022 BAS. Saving to file. Updating Insol.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 4/08/2022 0.40 $96.00|Drafting BAS periods May and June. Review, update. Collate, send for approval.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 26/08/2022 0.30 $72.00|Draft July BAS. Review / collate support docs and send for approval. Complete hard copy
BAS. Make adiustments

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 30/08/2022 0.20 $48.00|Lodgement BAS May, June and July. Saving to file. Update Insol.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 30/08/2022 0.10 $24.00|Updating figure on July BAS. Sending for approval.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 27/09/2022 0.20 $48.00|Draft BAS period August. Review and collate support docs for approval.

BR Sarah Cunningham |Accounting Assistant |Administration 28/09/2022 0.20 $48.00|Call with ATO discuss / review of status of BAS lodgements on ATO records.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 28/09/2022 0.10 $24.00|ATO lodgement Aug BAS. Save to file. Updating Insol.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 4/10/2022 0.10 $24.00|Bank Reconciliation 30 September.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 3/11/2022 0.80 $192.00|Draft Sept and Oct BAS. Review, complete, copy and send for approval. Reconcile 31.10

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 16/12/2022 0.10 $24.00|Reconciling acct Nov.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 21/12/2022 0.30 $72.00|Review / draft BAS Nov. Collate support docs and send for approval.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 12/01/2023 0.10 $24.00|Reconciling Dec 2022

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 23/01/2023 0.40 $96.00|Drafting Insol info / review and send for updates prior to final online ASIC draft of 5602.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 31/01/2023 0.70 $168.00|Draft manual 5602. Collate manual RP with report.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 7/02/2023 0.20 $48.00|Draft / review BAS Jan. Collate and send for approval.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 20/02/2023 0.10 $24.00|Lodging BAS NOV. Update Insol. Save to file. Followed up as outstanding.

BR Sarah Cunningham |Accounting Assistant |Administration 1/03/2023 0.10 $24.00|Reconciling account 28/02

BR Sarah Cunningham |Accounting Assistant |Administration 3/04/2023 0.10 $24.00|Reconcile to 31 March.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 11/04/2023 0.30 $72.00|Draft BAS Feb and March. Review / collate support docs and send for approval.

BR Sarah Cunningham [Accounting Assistant |Administration 20/04/2023 0.10 $24.00|Manually complete BAS for signing. Approved by David.

BR Laura Hagi Professional Services |Administration 22/07/2021 0.10 $18.50|prepare outgoing mail

Support
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BR Laura Hagi Professional Services |Administration 23/08/2022 0.30 $57.00|Stick labels and stuff envelopes. Place for collection

BR Laura Hagi ;:"Jc::’grs);onal Services |Administration 26/10/2022 0.10 $19.00|Stick labels and stuff envelopes. Update mailout register to assist with future client
Support related aueries. place for collection bv Facilities and Admin Team

BR Laura Hagi Professional Services |Administration 9/11/2022 0.20 $38.00|Prepare the printer for printing (time includes any printer related technical issues. Stick
Support labels and stuff envelopes. Place for collection. Update tracking register

BR Laura Hagi Professional Services |Administration 29/11/2022 0.10 $19.00|Stick labels and stuff envelopes. Update investor mailout register to assist with future
Support investor related queries, place for collection by Facilities and Admin Team x 1 letters

BR Laura Hagi Professional Services |Administration 16/12/2022 1.00 $190.00|prepare mailout to investors (55 letters to post)

BR Laura Hagi ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 16/12/2022 0.20 $38.00|prepare mailout of investor letters x 8, update register

BR Laura Hagi ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 25/01/2023 0.20 $38.00|Stick labels and stuff envelopes. Update mailout register to assist with future investor
Support related aueries. place for collection bv Facilities and Admin Team

BR Laura Hagi Professional Services |Administration 25/01/2023 0.20 $38.00|Stick labels and stuff envelopes. Update investor mailout register to assist with future
Support investor related aueries. place for collection bv Facilities and Admin Team

BR Moira Hattingh Professional Services |Administration 6/07/2021 0.10 $11.00(Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 8/07/2021 0.20 $22.00(Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 14/07/2021 0.10 $11.00|Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 15/07/2021 0.30 $33.00(Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 22/07/2021 0.20 $22.00(Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 28/07/2021 0.20 $22.00(Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 29/07/2021 0.30 $33.00(Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 12/08/2021 0.10 $11.00(Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 13/08/2021 0.30 $33.00(Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 18/08/2021 0.10 $11.00(Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 19/08/2021 0.70 $77.00][Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 24/08/2021 0.40 $44.00(Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 26/08/2021 0.40 $44.00(Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 31/08/2021 0.30 $33.00(Misc.

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 2/09/2021 0.10 $11.00(Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 8/09/2021 0.30 $33.00(Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 16/09/2021 1.40 $154.00(Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 22/09/2021 0.10 $11.00|Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 24/09/2021 0.30 $33.00(Filing

BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 29/09/2021 0.10 $11.00|Filing

Support
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BR Moira Hattingh Professional Services |Administration 1/10/2021 0.30 $33.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc::’grs);onal Services |Administration 6/10/2021 0.10 $11.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 7/10/2021 0.40 $44.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 13/10/2021 0.10 $11.00|Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 14/10/2021 0.20 $22.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 15/10/2021 0.30 $33.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 20/10/2021 0.10 $11.00|Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 21/10/2021 0.20 $22.00[Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 22/10/2021 0.10 $11.00]Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 27/10/2021 0.10 $11.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 28/10/2021 0.20 $22.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 5/11/2021 0.20 $22.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 10/11/2021 0.10 $11.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 12/11/2021 0.40 $44.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 17/11/2021 0.10 $11.00|Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 18/11/2021 0.30 $33.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 25/11/2021 0.30 $33.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 1/12/2021 0.10 $11.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 2/12/2021 0.20 $22.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 8/12/2021 0.10 $11.00|Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 9/12/2021 0.20 $22.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 14/12/2021 0.10 $11.00|Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 17/12/2021 0.20 $22.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 22/12/2021 0.10 $11.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 23/12/2021 0.20 $22.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 13/01/2022 0.40 $46.00|(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 14/01/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 18/01/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 21/01/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
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BR Moira Hattingh Professional Services |Administration 4/02/2022 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc::’grs);onal Services |Administration 8/02/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 11/02/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 17/02/2022 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 18/02/2022 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 22/02/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 24/02/2022 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 8/03/2022 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 10/03/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 11/03/2022 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 16/03/2022 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 17/03/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 18/03/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 24/03/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 7/04/2022 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 13/04/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 14/04/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 20/04/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 21/04/2022 0.40 $46.00(Misc.
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 27/04/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 28/04/2022 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 4/05/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 5/05/2022 0.30 $34.50(Misc.
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 6/05/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 10/05/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 11/05/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 12/05/2022 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 13/05/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 18/05/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing

Support

93




BR Moira Hattingh Professional Services |Administration 19/05/2022 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc::’grs);onal Services |Administration 26/05/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 1/06/2022 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 2/06/2022 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 8/06/2022 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 9/06/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 16/06/2022 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 17/06/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 22/06/2022 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 23/06/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 29/06/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 1/07/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 5/07/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 7/07/2022 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 8/07/2022 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 14/07/2022 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 15/07/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 19/07/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 21/07/2022 0.40 $46.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 28/07/2022 0.50 $57.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 29/07/2022 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 16/08/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 19/08/2022 0.50 $57.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 24/08/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 25/08/2022 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 26/08/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 2/09/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 7/09/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 8/09/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
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BR Moira Hattingh Professional Services |Administration 9/09/2022 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc::’grs);onal Services |Administration 16/09/2022 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 21/09/2022 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 28/09/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 4/10/2022 0.40 $46.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 7/10/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 12/10/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 13/10/2022 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 19/10/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 19/10/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 25/10/2022 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 28/10/2022 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 1/11/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 3/11/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 9/11/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 15/11/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 18/11/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 23/11/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 25/11/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 29/11/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 2/12/2022 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 6/12/2022 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 8/12/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 14/12/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 20/12/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 23/12/2022 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 10/01/2023 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 12/01/2023 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 13/01/2023 0.40 $46.00|(Filing
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BR Moira Hattingh Professional Services |Administration 18/01/2023 0.20 $23.00[Misc.
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc::’grs);onal Services |Administration 20/01/2023 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 24/01/2023 0.20 $23.00(Misc. Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 1/02/2023 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 2/02/2023 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 8/02/2023 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 9/02/2023 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 15/02/2023 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 16/02/2023 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 17/02/2023 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 23/02/2023 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 28/02/2023 0.10 $11.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 2/03/2023 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 8/03/2023 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 10/03/2023 0.20 $23.00(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 15/03/2023 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 17/03/2023 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 29/03/2023 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 31/03/2023 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 5/04/2023 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 6/04/2023 0.10 $11.50](Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 12/04/2023 0.30 $34.50(Filing
BR Moira Hattingh ;:"Jc;’grs);onal Services |Administration 20/04/2023 0.40 $46.00(Filing
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n DW_2||

BUSINESS RESTRUCTURING RATES

Staff Category Effective 1 Effective 1 Effective 1 July
January 2021 ($) January 2022 ($) 2022 (S)
1 Partner/Appointee 635 655 655
2 Director 540 555 555
3 Senior Manager 515 530 530
4 Manager 475 490 490
5 Assistant Manager 420 435 435
6 Senior Analyst (experienced) 380 390 390
7 Senior Analyst 340 350 350
8 Analyst 285 295 295
9 Graduate Analyst 230 240 240
10  Financial Assistant 230 240 195
11 Undergraduate 190 195 240
12 Practice Assistant 185 190 190
13 Administration Assistant 110 115 115

*All amounts are exclusive of GST

BDO Business Restructuring Pty Ltd ABN 90 134 036 507 is a member of a national association of independent entities which are all members of
BDO Australia Ltd ABN 77 050 110 275, an Australian company limited by guarantee. BDO Business Restructuring Pty Ltd and BDO Australia Ltd are
members of BDO International Ltd, a UK company limited by guarantee, and form part of the international BDO network of independent member
firms. Liability limited by a scheme approved under Professional Standards Legislation, other than for the acts or omissions of financial services
licensees.
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AUDIT CHARGE RATES

Staff Category

Partner - Clark Jarrold
Partner

Associate Director
Senior Manager
Manager

Assistant Manager
Senior Auditor - Experienced
Senior Auditor

Auditor

Graduate Auditor
Practice Assistant
Assistant Auditor

Junior Team Assistant

*All amounts are exclusive of GST

Effective 1
January 2021
($)

650
545
470
440
385
345
305
275
215
180
145
145
140

Effective 1
January 2022
)

650
570
495
460
405
360
320
290
225
190
150
150
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Practice Statement Insolvency 5: Remuneration
reporting
Approved: 24 November 2020 (Version 2)
This Practice Statement provides guidance to Members on:
e the information to be provided to creditors in respect of Remuneration for all
Administrations, excluding appointment as a Controller
¢ the information to be provided for the approval of Internal Disbursements for all
Administrations, excluding appointment as a Controller and
e guidance on information to be provided to the Court when seeking approval of
Remuneration.

This guidance is compliant with the ARITA Code and the requirements of the relevant Legislation.

This version of the PSl is effective from 31 March 2021. Earlier adoption of this PSI is permitted.

Contents
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Appendix 2: Template — Initial Remuneration NOUCE ..........ccccuvviiiiee i 22
Appendix 3: Template — Remuneration Approval REPOI...........ccviieeiiiiiiiiiiiiee e e 25
Appendix 4: Guidance for Court appliCatioNS ............eeeiieeiiiiiiiiiieie e e 53

Refer also to

Code of Ethics

COPP: Insolvency Services, section 5
PSI8: Remuneration

PSI7: Disbursements and Expenses
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5.1 Interpretation and Definitions

Members must refer to Sections 3 and 4 of the COPP: Introduction for how the Practice Statement
is to be interpreted and applied.

Definitions that apply to the Standard are at Section 6 of the COPP: Introduction.

5.2 Reporting points

There may potentially be four different points where information about Remuneration is reported to
creditors:

1. Pre-appointment proposed basis of remuneration disclosure to directors/individual
Insolvents in director or debtor led Appointments

2. Initial Remuneration Notice to creditors (with the first communication)

3. Remuneration Approval Report to creditors (before approval of Remuneration)

4. Reporting to creditors about outcomes and Remuneration drawn (optional).

In some instances, a Member may choose to seek approval of Remuneration in the same report
as the Initial Remuneration Notice. This is acceptable as long as all reporting requirements are
included.

Members can choose to report back to creditors about outcomes and Remuneration drawn. Where
there are insufficient funds to meet the cost of this additional report, Members do not have to do
so.

Members should note the specific legal requirements in relation to Remuneration Claim Notices for
personal insolvency Administrations.

More than one request for the approval of Remuneration may be made during the conduct of an
Administration.

9. PSI 5 REMUNERATION REPORTING APPROVED 24 NOV 2020.DOCX

AUSTRALIAN RESTRUCTURING INSOLVENCY & TURNAROUND ASSOCIATION PAGE 2
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5.3

Timing of information

A

ARITA

The table below summarises the timing of the provision of information for each Remuneration
basis. Full details of reporting requirements appears at 5.4 below.

Basis of
Remuneration

Pre-appointment
proposed basis
of remuneration

Initial
Remuneration
Notice (IRN) -
First
communication
after
Appointment

Remuneration
Approval Report
(RAR) - after
appointment or
during
Administration

During the
Administration
(Remuneration
Approval Report
(RAR) or report on
remuneration
drawn)

Time based

Prospective
Fee
(time based)

Fixed fee

Percentage

Contingency

Advice on the
Remuneration
basis that is
proposed to be
used for the
administration and
an estimate of the
cost (not
mandatory).
Applicable to
director or Debtor
led appointments
only.

Advice on the
basis chosen and
rates (if time
based).

Estimate of fees
(must be provided)
and comparison to
the pre-
appointment
estimate, (if one
was provided).

The method for
the calculation of
internal and
external
disbursements.

Report on work
undertaken and
request approval of
quantum.
Comparison to initial
estimate of fees
provided to creditors
in IRN.

Report on work
undertaken and
request further
approvals (if
required).

Request for approval

for time based

charging to a capped

Report on work
undertaken and
request further

amount. approvals (if
Comparison to initial required).
estimate of fees

provided to creditors

in IRN.

Request for approval Report on

of the quantum.
Comparison to initial
estimate of fees
provided to creditors
in IRN.

achievement of
milestones for the
drawing of
Remuneration.

Request for approval

of the arrangement.
Comparison to initial
estimate of fees
provided to creditors
in IRN.

Report on the factors
underlying the
entitlement to claim
the Remuneration.

Report on the
achievement of the
contingency event or
otherwise.

Note:

Mixed Fee Arrangements: There will be circumstances where a Member will seek approval for a different
basis of Remuneration for a particular aspect of an appointment or finalisation of the appointment; the
appropriate information (refer 5.4 below) will need to be provided at the time of seeking the creditors’ approval
of that arrangement.

AUSTRALIAN RESTRUCTURING INSOLVENCY & TURNAROUND ASSOCIATION

9. PSI 5 REMUNERATION REPORTING APPROVED 24 NOV 2020.DOCX

PAGE 3
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ARITA
5.4 Information to be provided

Refer also to
e COPP: Insolvency Services, section 5
e PSI8: Remuneration
e PSI7: Disbursements

Basis of Fee Approval

Time — Retrospective Time — Prospective Fixed Percentage Contingent
Pre-appointment e A brief explanation of the types of methods that can be used to calculate Remuneration
proposed basis of
remuneration (to e The particular method or methods that the Member intends to use to calculate Remuneration in the Administration

directors/individual
appointments only)

(Refer Appendix 1 for
template) e An explanation that:

Professional Practice;

Administration.

Insolvent in debtor led e An explanation why the Member considers this method to be suitable for the Administration

e The scale of hourly rates to be applied (where Remuneration will be sought on a time basis)

- creditors will be advised of the basis proposed to directors/individual Insolvent; and
- if the directors/individual Insolvent or other Entity has made, or will be making, an Upfront Payment for the purposes of
the Member’s Remuneration, approved Remuneration over and above this amount can be paid from the assets of the

- the actual Remuneration drawn in the Administration will be that approved by the Approving body after the Approving
body is provided with a Remuneration report in accordance with the applicable Legislation and ARITA Code of

AUSTRALIAN RESTRUCTURING INSOLVENCY & TURNAROUND ASSOCIATION

PAGE 4
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Basis of Fee Approval

Time — Retrospective

Time — Prospective Fixed Percentage Contingent

Pre-appointment
proposed basis of
remuneration (to
directors/individual
Insolvent in debtor led
appointments only)
(continued)

There is no mandatory requirement to provide an estimate of cost of the Administration to the directors/individual Insolvent,
but where an estimate of the cost of the Administration is provided, it has to be in writing to the directors/individual Insolvent
as part of the pre-appointment disclosure, clearly detailing any variables which may affect the estimate.

Advise the director/individual Insolvent that:

- creditors will be advised of the estimate provided to the directors/individual Insolvent;

- the actual Remuneration may exceed that estimate and this higher amount can be approved by the Approving body; and

- if the estimate provided differs to any subsequent estimate provided to creditors, an explanation of the variance will be
provided to creditors.

Initial Remuneration
Notice (IRN)

(Refer Appendix 2 for
template)

The following information is provided to creditors regarding Remuneration in their first communication with creditors pursuant to
IPR 70-35 for all Administrations except Appointments as a Controller:

a brief explanation of the types of methods that can be used to calculate Remuneration

the particular method or methods that the Member intends to use to calculate Remuneration in the Administration

why the Member considers this method to be suitable for the Administration

an estimate of the expected amount of the Administrator's Remuneration and any factors that will affect that estimate
details of any estimate or fee provided to directors/individual Insolvent prior to the appointment; and

if the estimate or fee provided to the directors/individual Insolvent is now different to the estimate provided in the IRN, an
explanation of the change from the pre-appointment information provided.

details of the basis of recovering any internally generated Disbursements that will be charged to the Administration (e.g.
Page rate for photocopying done internally)

details of the basis of recovering any external disbursements that will be charged to the Administration (e.g. at cost)

If a Member is intending to use time based
Remuneration (either retrospectively or prospectively),
they have to also provide the scale of rates that will be
used, including qualifications and experience
generally of staff at each level.

AUSTRALIAN RESTRUCTURING INSOLVENCY & TURNAROUND ASSOCIATION
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Basis of Fee Approval

Time — Retrospective

Time — Prospective

Fixed

Percentage

Contingent

Remuneration Approval
Report (RAR)

(Refer Appendix 3 for
template)

Note: This table includes
requirements from the
Corporations Act/
Bankruptcy Act and
COPP: Insolvency
Services for a RAR

Details of the Remuneration claimed

ARITA’s recommended Remuneration Approval Report (RAR) template, as adapted for the facts and circumstances of the
particular Administration, should be used as the means of giving creditors the information they need to make an informed
decision at the meeting as to the reasonableness of the Remuneration. It is a guide for time based Remuneration claims
(retrospective and prospective) and may assist with other bases of Remuneration claims. If broadly followed, the proposed format

constitutes good practice.

Where a time based
Remuneration claim for
retrospective fees is being
made, the Member will
need to report to the
relevant Approving body
on:

e adescription of work
performed, broken
down into the major
tasks

e the amount of time
spent on each major
task

e the costs of each
major task

e the classification of
staff engaged on the
Administration for
each major task

Where a time based
Remuneration claim for
prospective fees is being
made, the Member will
need to report to the
relevant Approving body
on:

e asummary
description of the
major tasks still
remaining to be done
for the period that the
Remuneration is
sought (e.g. to
completion or other
relevant milestone);

e an explanation of the
estimated fees
remaining to
complete the
Administration (or to
the next major

Where a fixed fee is
claimed, the Member
will need to report to
the relevant
Approving body on:

e the amount of the
fixed fee
proposed;

e the basis upon
which the fee has
been calculated
(work to be
undertaken and
the costs for each
category of work
and scope of
work) in the same
manner as for
prospective fees;

e the services to be
provided for the
fixed fee amount

Where a percentage
based claim is made,
information must be
provided to the
relevant Approving
body to enable it to
make an informed
assessment of
whether the
percentage is
reasonable. The
Member will need to
report to the relevant
Approving body on:

e the percentage
proposed,;

e the nature and
estimated value
of the individual
assets realised or
to be realised (or
if the percentage

If a contingency
arrangement within the
scope of the COPP:
Insolvency Services is
proposed, there will
need to be full
disclosure of the
proposed arrangement
to the relevant
Approving body,
including:

e exactly what the
arrangement is
contingent upon;

e how achievement
of the contingency
will be assessed;

e what the
Member’s
Remuneration will
be, or range of
Remuneration, in

AUSTRALIAN RESTRUCTURING INSOLVENCY & TURNAROUND ASSOCIATION
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ARITA

Basis of Fee Approval

Time — Retrospective

Time — Prospective

Fixed

Percentage

Contingent

Remuneration Approval
Report (RAR)
(continued)

e whenitis proposed
that the fees be
drawn.

The Member needs to

make a declaration that

that the work in progress
report for the

Administration has been

reviewed to ensure that

Remuneration is only

being claimed for

necessary and proper
work.

milestone) including
the estimated fees
for each major task;

e amonetary ‘cap’ on
the Remuneration;

e whenitis proposed
that the fees be
drawn (for example,
monthly).

in sufficient detail
for the Approving
body to make an
informed decision
about why the fee
is reasonable;

e what services will
not be included in
the fixed fee and
the basis of
charging for
these excluded
services; and

e the milestones as
to when
Remuneration will
be drawn from
the
Administration.

Note: a Member must
not draw fixed fee
Remuneration up-
front (COPP:
Insolvency Services
3.2.5).

A Member seeking a
fixed fee basis for
Remuneration needs
to include in the

is to be applied to
another factor,
the value of that
factor);

e the formula to be

applied for
calculation of the
Remuneration;

e what services are

to be provided for
this percentage
amount and the
tasks that will
comprise this
work;

e what work has

been, or is
intended to be
outsourced that
would normally
be carried out by
the Member or
their staff and
whether this
outsourced work
will be billed
separately or
included in the
percentage
based

the event that the
contingency is or
is not achieved;

e why a contingency
arrangement is in
the best interests
of creditors; and

e when the
Remuneration will
be drawn.

If a Member is
intending to make a
claim for
Remuneration on a
contingency basis, it is
recommended that
disclosure is made and
approval received from
creditors prior to the
work commencing.
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ARITA
Basis of Fee Approval
Time — Retrospective Time — Prospective Fixed Percentage Contingent
quote for the fixed fee Remuneration
the: claim;
Remuneration Approval e the milestones as
Report (RAR) e costs of all to when the
(continued) statutory Remuneration will
investigations; be drawn from
e costs of reporting the
to the creditors Administration;
and Regulators; and
e cost of issuing e the expected
letters of demand range of possible
for preferences; Remuneration
and outcomes.
* ;ﬁs;tsagt(r;setmg Full (_jisclosure to
obligations. creditors of the terms
of the arrangement,
Example and the expected
Acceptable Remuneration
exclusions outcome, or range of
possible outcomes to
e litigation for minimise any )
recovery of perception of conflict
preference of interest.
payments. .
e litigation for If a Member is
insolvent trading. | inténding to make a
claim for
If a Member is Remuneration on a
intending to make a percentage basis, it is
recommended that
AUSTRALIAN RESTRUCTURING INSOLVENCY & TURNAROUND ASSOCIATION PAGE 8
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ARITA

Basis of Fee Approval

Time — Retrospective

Time — Prospective

Fixed

Percentage

Contingent

Remuneration Approval
Report (RAR)
(continued)

claim for
Remuneration on a
fixed fee basis, this
must be done at the
first opportunity after
the Member is
appointed. The only
exceptions to this are
where a Member
chooses to make a
claim for a fixed fee
to enable finalisation
of the Administration,
or for a specific
aspect of the
Administration.

this be done at the
first opportunity after
the Member is
appointed. An
exception to this is
where a Member
chooses to make a
claim for
Remuneration on a
percentage basis to
undertake a particular
task (eg. litigation).

Include the following in RAR for all Remuneration types:

e Adeclaration that the Remuneration claimed is necessary and proper.

e Comparison of the estimated Remuneration previously provided with the actual Remuneration approval sought and

provide an explanation for any variance.

e Statement of Remuneration claim — The Member should clearly:

o state the precise terms of the agreement(s) sought from the committee or the resolution(s) sought from creditors

including the amount to be approved and when the Remuneration will be drawn. Separate statements of

Remuneration claim are required for each distinct Remuneration period (e.g. retrospective and prospective); and

o set out the total Remuneration previously determined.
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ARITA

Basis of Fee Approval

Time — Retrospective Time — Prospective Fixed Percentage Contingent

Remuneration Approval
Report (RAR)
(continued)

e A statement as to whether they anticipate that there will be any further request for approval of Remuneration in the future.

e An estimated total amount, or range of total amounts, of the Remuneration for the external administration must be
provided.

e An explanation on the likely impact of Remuneration on the dividends (if any) to creditors.

e Details of any Remuneration recoverable from external sources must be provided. This would include upfront or
indemnity payments from directors or other parties, FEG Remuneration payments, Assetless Administration Fund funding,
payments from secured creditors and litigation or creditor funding.

¢ Include the following information on Disbursements:

O
O
O

general information on the different classes of Disbursements (or refer to the information provided in the IRN);
a declaration that the Disbursements were necessary and proper;
in relation to Internal Disbursements to be paid to the Firm:

- what the Disbursement was for;
- the quantity and rate (only for Internal Disbursements); and
- the amount to be claimed; and

details of the basis of any internal Disbursements that will be charged to the Administration in the future (eg. Page
rate for photocopying done internally).

payments direct to third parties from the Administration bank account and Disbursements (with no profit) only need to
be clearly included in the receipts and payments (as long as who the payment was made to and what the payment is
for is identifiable). If not clearly identifiable in the receipts and payments, they need to be detailed in the body of the
report.
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ARITA

Basis of Fee Approval

Time — Retrospective Time — Prospective Fixed Percentage Contingent

o Information on the resolutions that will be put to creditors for the approval of Internal disbursements/the basis of
future Internal disbursements to a Capped amount.

Remuneration Approval

Report (RAR) e Ageneral report providing the creditors with information about the progress of the Administration, detailing matters resolved

(continued) and those matters still outstanding.

The general report should assist creditors with understanding:

e matters that may have contributed to the Remuneration claim;

o complexities or difficulties that have been faced by the Member;

e goals that have been achieved since the last report;

e outcomes including explanations as to why that outcome was better or worse than originally predicted; and
o future tasks to be undertaken and why they need to be done.

e A summary of receipts and payments to and from the Administration bank account must be provided. The receipts and
payments summary should be prepared up to a date that is as close as possible to the date on which the notice and report is
given to creditors. The summary should be clearly labelled as being prepared ‘as at’ a particular date or for a specified
period. If large or exceptional receipts and payments are received or made after the report is prepared but before the meeting
at which the Remuneration claim is to be considered, the Member should provide additional information to committee
members or creditors at the meeting.

e Where a Creditor information sheet on Remuneration is available, the information sheet or information on how to access it
must be provided (if not previously provided).

e Details on how to obtain further information.

e For personal insolvency Administrations only, a statement advising creditors/the individual insolvent of their right to request a
Remuneration Claim Notice, within 20 business days after receiving the Remuneration Approval Report.

AUSTRALIAN RESTRUCTURING INSOLVENCY & TURNAROUND ASSOCIATION PAGE 11
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RITA

Basis of Fee Approval

Time — Retrospective

Time — Prospective

Fixed

Percentage

Contingent

Future reporting and/or
further Remuneration
Approval Reports

Any further Remuneration
Approval Reports for
retrospective fees on time
basis have the same
reporting requirements as
the first RAR.

In addition, the Approving
body must be advised on:

¢ Remuneration already
drawn under prior
approval(s);

e comparison of actual
fees to the estimated
fees provided in the
initial or subsequent
advice to creditors.

If there has been prior
prospective Remuneration
previously approved,
provide a detailed
explanation as to why
further Remuneration
approval is being sought,
including why the
prospective Remuneration
amount approved has
been exceeded (if

Any further fee
Remuneration Approval
Reports for prospective
fees on a time basis have
the same reporting
requirements as the first
RAR. In addition, the
Approving body must be
advised on:

e Remuneration
already drawn under
the prospective
approval;

e adetailed
explanation as to
why further
Remuneration
approval is being
sought, including why
the prospective
Remuneration
amount previously
approved has been
exceeded (if
applicable) and
explain any tasks
that still remain to be
completed and the
expected cost of
those tasks.

Once a fee is fixed for
an agreed task, set of
tasks or the conduct
of the Administration,
it remains fixed and a
Member must not
seek further approval
if the original estimate
is wrong (COPP:
Insolvency Services
3.2.5).

After approval of a
fixed fee,
Remuneration
reporting will focus on
the progress of the
work in the
Administration, for
example by way of
explaining milestone
achievements, and
the work still to be
done.

Future reporting to
creditors will need to
focus on the factors
underlying the
entitlement to claim
the Remuneration, for
example by way of
reporting on asset
realisations and the
percentage taken
from those
realisations to pay
Remuneration.

Future reporting to
creditors will need to
include information on
whether the Member
has achieved the
contingency and the
effect on the
calculation of the
Member’s
Remuneration.
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PAGE 12




A

ARITA

Basis of Fee Approval
Time — Retrospective Time — Prospective Fixed Percentage Contingent
applicable) and explain The above applies even
any tasks that still remain | if the Member is only
Future reporting and/or | to be completed and the seeking an increase in
further Remuneration expected cost of those the previously set capped
Approval Reports tasks. amount.
(continued)
If possible, an explanation | If the Member is seeking
as to what further fee an increase in the
approvals may be sought | capped amount or an
in the future, even if additional prospective fee
prospective fee approval approval amount, they
is not being sought at this | will need to provide the
time. Approving body with an
explanation as to the
If prospective fee reason for the change in
approval is being sought, | the capped amount.
refer to that column for
guidance on reporting If a Member wishes to
requirements. change the rate scale
other than as agreed, the
Member will need to seek
Approving body approval
and provide the
Approving body with an
explanation as to the
reason for the change in
the rate scale.
AUSTRALIAN RESTRUCTURING INSOLVENCY & TURNAROUND ASSOCIATION PAGE 13
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ARITA

Basis of Fee Approval

Time — Retrospective Time — Prospective Fixed

Percentage

Contingent

Mixed Bases

If a mix of bases are proposed to be used, the Member will need to clearly set out what basis applies to what tasks and report on

each different basis using the above guidance.
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5.5 Sources of Funding

Refer also to

e COPP: Insolvency Services, section 5.9

55.1 FEG payments

Funding received in relation to Fair Entittements Guarantee (FEG) to facilitate a FEG distribution
to employees may be a limited or partial funding agreement. As such, where higher fees are
incurred than the amount agreed with FEG there is no restriction in the administration being
charged for the shortfall on the basis that all Remuneration claimed is necessary and properly
incurred in accordance with ARITA’s Code.

While the money received from FEG is not subject to Approving Body approval and can be paid
directly to the Appointee, any shortfall must be appropriately approved in accordance with the
relevant legislation prior to drawing. In seeking creditor approval for any shortfall, Members must
provide separate disclosure of the total time charged, FEG receipt(s) and any shortfall amount in
the Remuneration report.

Members must ensure that they do not “double dip” in relation to FEG Remuneration and that the
amount received from FEG is allocated to the Administration. To facilitate this, Members must
ensure that any work undertaken in relation FEG distributions is appropriately identified in their
time recording system, including an adjustment for any direct payments from FEG.

5.5.2 Assetless Administration funding

Funding received from ASIC under the AAF may be a limited or partial funding agreement. As
such, if higher fees are incurred than the amount agreed with ASIC there is no restriction in the
administration being charged for the shortfall on the basis that all Remuneration claimed is
necessary and properly incurred in accordance with ARITA’s Code.

Members should refer to RG 109 for ASIC guidance on whether approval is required for funding
from the AAF.

If approval is not required, any shortfall must be appropriately approved in accordance with the
Corporations Act prior to drawing. In seeking creditor approval for any shortfall, Members must
provide separate disclosure of the total time charged, ASIC receipt(s) and any shortfall amount in
the Remuneration Approval Report.

Members must ensure that they do not “double dip” in relation to this Remuneration and that the
amount received from ASIC is allocated to the Administration. To facilitate this, Members must
ensure that any work undertaken for ASIC in relation the AAF is appropriately identified in their
time recording system, including an adjustment for any direct payments from ASIC.
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5.5.3 Litigation funding
Remuneration from litigation funding from any source, must be:

e paid into and drawn from the Administration bank account; and
o disclosed and approved in accordance with the requirements of the COPP: Insolvency
Services.

554 Creditor funding
Remuneration from funding by creditors provided for any purpose, must be:

e paid into and drawn from the Administration bank account; and
o disclosed and approved in accordance with the requirements of the COPP: Insolvency
Services.

5.5.5 Secured creditor funding

Where secured assets are realised in the course of an Administration, except for Appointments
as a Controller, any Remuneration in relation to the realisations, including funds withheld from
realisations or payments made directly by the Secured Creditor, must be:

e paid into and drawn from the Administration bank account; and
o disclosed and approved in accordance with the requirements of the COPP: Insolvency
Services.

5.6 Templates

There are three templates provided in this Practice Statement:

1. Pre-appointment proposed basis of remuneration disclosure (Appendix 1)
2. Initial Remuneration Notice to creditors (Appendix 2)
3. Remuneration Approval Report to creditors (Appendix 3)

The recommended format for a report to creditors could be used by Members seeking
retrospective and/or prospective determination of Remuneration on a time basis, although
aspects of the report may be useful for other Remuneration bases.

This report might not be suitable for reporting on Remuneration for an appointment as a
Controller, and Members are encouraged to seek guidance from their appointor as to the
required format of their Remuneration reporting.

Reports have to be tailored to the particular circumstances of each Administration.
Members have to exercise their professional judgment when putting together a report to
committee members or creditors.

It is recommended that the Remuneration Approval Report accompany, or be combined with, a
general report that the Member is preparing for committee members or creditors. For example,
where a voluntary administrator is seeking the determination of Remuneration at the meeting to
consider the company’s future and the Member is already under an obligation to prepare
Voluntary Administrator’s report under IPR Corp 75-225, the Remuneration Approval Report
should be provided to creditors at the same time.

Committee members or creditors might not be familiar with insolvency procedures and are not
being remunerated for their time. Therefore, providing more information does not necessarily
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inform creditors in a more effective manner than providing less: it is the relevance and quality of
the information, rather than the quantity, that is the key.

It is good practice for committee members or creditors to be made aware that all supporting
documentation may be viewed if requested, provided sufficient notice is given to the Member.

5.7 Court applications

Applications to the Court may be made where approval of Remuneration is unable to be obtained
from the Committee of Inspection (if there is one) or the creditors.

An application to the Court will require an affidavit. A list of matters that could be considered for
inclusion in the affidavit material is included at Appendix 4.

5.8 Version information

Version number Approved date Effective date
Version 1 16 September 2019 1 January 2020
Version 2 24 November 2020 31 March 2021
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Appendix 1: Template — Pre-appointment proposed basis of
Remuneration disclosure

This is the suggested format for the pre-appointment advice to directors/individual Insolvents
regarding the proposed basis of Remuneration. This advice is to be used for all Appointments
made by directors/Debtors, this specifically excludes Controllers, members’ voluntary liquidations
or any Appointment made by the court.

This template has been prepared on the basis that no fixed fee or quote has been provided by
the Member — only an estimate. If a fixed fee or quote has been provided, you will need to
customise this template accordingly.
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Remuneration advice

[Insolvent]
ACN [ACN] (if applicable)

Introduction

You have requested that | consent to act as [appointment type] for the above company. This
information sheet is to assist you with understanding how remuneration is calculated and paid in
a [administration type].

Whilst I may provide you with an estimate of the cost of the [administration type] in this
document, | advise that the actual remuneration drawn will be subject to the approval of the
creditors, committee of creditors or court, after | have provided a remuneration approval report.

If | have provided you with an estimate of the cost of the administration, this information will be
provided to creditors in my initial remuneration notice. However, the actual remuneration that is
approved by creditors may exceed this estimate and this higher amount can be approved by the
creditors, a committee of the creditors (called a Committee of Inspection) or the court. If the
estimate that | provide to creditors differs to the estimate that | have provided to you, | will
provide an explanation to creditors for the variance. [if no estimate is provided, delete this
paragraph — any estimates provided verbally should be confirmed in writing]

If you have paid or are paying money up front, or are providing me with an indemnity, for the
purposes of my remuneration, you should be aware that approved remuneration may exceed this
amount and can be paid from the assets of the [administration type].[if no indemnity or Upfront
Payment, this paragraph can be deleted.]

Remuneration Methods

There are four basic methods that can be used to calculate the remuneration charged in a
[administration type]. They are:

A. Time based / hourly rates: This is the most common method. The total fee charged is
based on the hourly rate charged for each person who carried out the work multiplied by
the number of hours spent by each person on each of the tasks performed.

B. Fixed Fee: The total fee charged is normally quoted at the commencement of the
administration and is the total cost for the administration. Sometimes a [appointment
type] will finalise an administration for a fixed fee.

C. Percentage: The total fee charged is based on a percentage of a particular variable,
such as the gross proceeds of assets realisations.

D. Contingency: The fee is structured to be contingent on a particular outcome being
achieved.

Method proposed

Given the nature of this administration, | propose that my remuneration will be calculated on
[insert basis]. This is because:

. [Provide reasoning for the fee calculation method chosen.]

Examples of reasoning for choosing time based Remuneration:
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- It ensures that creditors are only charged for work that is performed.

- I will be required to perform a number of tasks which do not relate to the realisation of
assets, for example responding to creditor enquiries, reporting to ASIC, distributing funds
in accordance with the provisions of the Corporations Act or the Bankruptcy Act.

- | am unable to estimate with certainty the total amount of fees necessary to complete all
tasks required in the Administration.

- | have a time recording system that can produce a detailed analysis of time spent on
each type of task by each individual staff member utilised in the administration;

- time based remuneration calculates fees upon a basis of time spent at the level
appropriate to the work performed;

- the method provides full accountability in the method of calculation]
Details of the hourly rates are included below. [delete if hourly rates are not being used]

Creditors will be advised of the proposed basis of remuneration in my initial remuneration advice
to them.

Estimate of the cost of the administration

[If you are providing the directors/individual Insolvent with an estimate of the cost of the
administration, that information should be provided here. If an estimate is not being provided, this
section can be deleted.]

| estimate that this administration will cost approximately $[amount] to complete, subject to the
following variables which may have a significant effect on this estimate and that | am unable to
determine until | have commenced the [administration type]:

e [list variables here]
Explanation of Hourly Rates

[Use the following guidance for time based remuneration only. Not required for other bases of
remuneration.]

The rates for my remuneration calculation are set out in the following table together with a
general guide showing the qualifications and experience of staff engaged in the administration
and the role they take in the administration. The hourly rates charged encompass the total cost of
providing professional services and should not be compared to an hourly wage.
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Title 2

Description 3

Hourly Rate
(excl GST)

Appointee

Director

Senior Manager

Manager

Supervisor

Senior

Intermediate

Secretary

Clerk

Junior

B BB |R BB |R BB |P

[Notes:

1. Delete these notes from the completed table.

2. Each firm should develop a table which is appropriate for their firm using the columns set
down in the above table.

2. These are example titles only. Each firm should use the titles appropriate to their firm.

3. Information that should be incorporated in the description column includes years of
experience, qualifications, education, staff supervised etc.]

Acknowledgement

To acknowledge that you have received and understood the information that | have provided to

you, please sign and date this document and return it to me on or before making the

appointment.

Sign:
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Appendix 2: Template — Initial Remuneration Notice

Initial Remuneration Notice

Insolvent Name ([Basis of appointment])
ACN/Estate reference

The purpose of the Initial Remuneration Notice is to provide you with information about how |
propose my remuneration for undertaking the [administration type] will be set.

1 Remuneration Methods

There are four basic methods that can be used to calculate the remuneration charged by an
insolvency practitioner in an [administration type]. They are:

A. Time based / hourly rates: This is the most common method. The total fee charged is
based on the hourly rate charged for each person who carried out the work multiplied by
the number of hours spent by each person on each of the tasks performed.

B. Fixed Fee: The total fee charged is normally quoted at the commencement of the
administration and is the total cost for the administration. Sometimes a [appointment
type] will finalise an administration for a fixed fee.

C. Percentage: The total fee charged is based on a percentage of a particular variable,
such as the gross proceeds of assets realisations.

D. Contingency: The fee is structured to be contingent on a particular outcome being
achieved.

2 Method chosen

Given the nature of this administration, | propose that my remuneration be calculated on [insert
basis]. This is because:

. [Provide reasoning for the fee calculation method chosen.
Examples of reasoning for choosing time based Remuneration:
- It ensures that creditors are only charged for work that is performed.

- | am required to perform a number of tasks which do not relate to the realisation of
assets, for example responding to creditor enquiries, reporting to ASIC, distributing funds
in accordance with the provisions of the Corporations Act or the Bankruptcy Act.

- | am unable to estimate with certainty the total amount of fees necessary to complete all
tasks required in the Administration.

- | have a time recording system that can produce a detailed analysis of time spent on
each type of task by each individual staff member utilised in the administration;

- time based remuneration calculates fees upon a basis of time spent at the level
appropriate to the work performed:;

- the method provides full accountability in the method of calculation.
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If you have chosen a basis other than time based remuneration, you will have to provide reasons
for the basis that you have chosen.]

3 Explanation of Hourly Rates

[Use the following guidance for time based remuneration only. Not required for other bases of
remuneration.]

The rates for my remuneration calculation are set out in the following table together with a
general guide showing the qualifications and experience of staff engaged in the administration
and the role they take in the administration. The hourly rates charged encompass the total cost of
providing professional services and should not be compared to an hourly wage.

Title 2 Description 3 Hourly Rate
(excl GST)

Appointee

Director

Senior Manager

Manager

Supervisor

Senior

Intermediate

Secretary

Clerk

Junior

[Notes:

1. Delete these notes when the table is completed.

2. Each firm should develop a table which is appropriate for their firm using the columns set down in the
above table.

2.  These are example titles only. Each firm should use the titles appropriate to their firm.

3. Information that should be incorporated in the description column includes years of experience,
qualifications, education, staff supervised etc.]

R B PR |B| B |RB | B |R

4 Estimated remuneration

[The Act requires that you provide an estimate of the expected amount of remuneration for the
Administration (corporate and personal) — IPR 70-35. You can provide a range.]

| estimate that this [administration/estate] will cost approximately $XXX to $XXX to complete,
subject to the following variables which may have a significant effect on this estimate and that |
am unable to determine at this early stage:

o [list variables here]

[If you provided an estimate to the directors/Debtor prior to your appointment, provide details
here, otherwise delete this paragraph]Prior to my appointment, | provided an estimate of the cost
of the administration to the directors. [Comment on the estimate provided to directors/individual
Insolvent in the Pre-appointment proposed basis of remuneration. Example: This estimate is
consistent with the estimate provided to the [directors/[Debtor Name]] prior to my appointment
OR This estimate varies from the estimate provided to [the directors/[Debtor Name]] prior to my
appointment for the following reasons:

e (provide reasons).]
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[If you have received an Upfront Payment or Indemnity, insert the details here, otherwise delete
this paragraph]l received an [up-front payment OR indemnity] to contribute to the estimated
costs. [Insert basic details of party providing up-front payment or indemnity and amount]. This
has been disclosed in my declaration of relevant relationships and indemnities. Approved
remuneration may exceed the amount of this [up-front payment OR indemnity] and can be paid
from the assets of the administration after approval by creditors or the Court.

5 Disbursements
Disbursements are divided into three types:

e External professional services - these are recovered at cost. An example of an
externally provided professional service is legal fees. It does not include insolvency
services, as insolvency services are claimed as remuneration.

e External non-professional costs — these are recovered at cost. Examples of external
non-professional expenses include travel, accommodation and search fees.

e Firm non-professional costs — such as photocopying, printing and postage. These
costs, if charged to the Administration, would generally be charged at cost; though some
expenses such as telephone calls, photocopying and printing may be charged at a rate
which recoups both variable and fixed costs. The recovery of these costs must be on a
reasonable commercial basis.

| am not required to seek creditor approval for expenses paid to third parties or for disbursements
where | am recovering a cost incurred on behalf of the administration, but | must account to
creditors. | must be satisfied that these expenses and disbursements are appropriate, justified
and reasonable.

| am required to obtain creditor’s consent for the payment of a disbursement where |, or a related
entity of myself, may directly or indirectly obtain a profit. In these circumstances, creditors will be
asked to approve my disbursements prior to these disbursements being paid from the
administration.

Details of the basis of recovering disbursements in this administration are provided below.

Disbursement type [Suggestion only — delete or add as Rate (excl GST)

appropriate]

External professional services At Cost

External non-professional services At Cost

Firm non-professional costs
Phone calls At Cost
Binding $XX per bind
Faxes $XX per page
Photocopying $XX per page
Stationery — folders $XX per folder
Stationery — filing index $XX per set
Staff per diem travel allowance $XX per day
Staff vehicle use $XX per km

Scale applicable for the financial year ending 30 June 20[xx]

[Date of issue]
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Appendix 3: Template — Remuneration Approval Report
Remuneration Approval Report

[Company]
ACN [ACN]

1. Summary

If this is not a VA:
| am asking creditors to approve my remuneration of $X [and disbursements of $D].
OR If this is for a VA:

| am asking creditors to approve the following remuneration and disbursements:

Remuneration Disbursements
Voluntary Administration $ $
If a DOCA is accepted $ $
If company is liquidated $ $

If there is more than one resolution being sought add this sentence for all administrations: Details
of remuneration and disbursements can be found in sections 3 and 4 of this report.

[Creditors will be asked to pass resolutions at the meeting on [date] OR | am asking creditors to
approve my remuneration via a proposal without a meeting.]

[Creditors have previously approved my remuneration of $Y [and disbursements of $D2].

If there was a previous administration type (eg. VA preceding a CVL) then provide a breakdown
of the previously approved remuneration and disbursements for each administration.

Consider whether a small table may be more suitable where there have been multiple
administrations. For example:

Creditors have previously approved my remuneration [and disbursements] of:

Remuneration Disbursements
Liquidation $ $
Previous voluntary $ $
administration

| estimate that the total cost of this [appointment type] will be $SEST [amount or range]. [This is
consistent with the previous estimates that | provided to you OR this has increased/decreased
from my previous estimate because of [detailed reasons]]

[This is my final remuneration approval request OR | expect that there will be [...explain what
further remuneration approval requests will be made, including if possible likely timing of future
requests and why approval will be sought. For example: At this stage | am only seeking approval
of initial remuneration to allow me to commence my investigations and attend to my statutory
duties. | will be seeking further approval of remuneration when | send out my three-month report
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to creditors. At that time, | will have a better understanding of actions that | will need to take in

the liquidation.].

2. Declaration

| have undertaken an assessment of this remuneration [and disbursement] claim in accordance
with the law and applicable professional standards. | am satisfied that the remuneration [and
disbursements] claimed is necessary and proper.

Only for retrospective time-based claims - | have reviewed the work in progress report for the
[appointment type] to ensure that remuneration is only being claimed for necessary and proper
work performed and [have made the following adjustments: (list adjustments made) OR no

adjustment was necessary.

3. Remuneration sought

The remuneration | am asking creditors to approve is as follows:

Table to specify components of remuneration resolutions to be put to meeting. Adjust information
provided if claim is not on a time basis — information provided should reflect components of
remuneration resolution(s) at Schedule C. Have regard to guidance in the Code and PSls about
information to be provided for different basis.

[Table format for administrations other than Vas (option for VA below)(amend as necessary):]

For Period Amount Rates to apply When it will be drawn
Work | have | [date] to $X (excluding | Provided in my [specify periods at which
already done | [date] GST) IRN sent to propose to withdraw
creditors on [IRN | funds to pay
date] remuneration. eg.
Immediately, when funds
are available or at the
end of the
[administration type]]
Future work | [date] to $X (excluding | [if remuneration is | [specify periods at which
[date] GST) time based, propose to withdraw
specify the hourly | funds to pay
rates that will be remuneration. eg.
applied and any monthly or at the end of
uplift to be the [administration type]]
applied in the
future]
TOTAL $[TOTAL]
(excluding
GST)

[Table format for VAs (amend as necessary):]

| will only seek approval of resolutions for the DOCA if creditors agree to the proposal offered.
Similarly, | will only seek approval of the resolution for the liquidation if creditors vote to place the

company into liquidation.

For Period Amount Rates to apply When it will be drawn
Work | have [date] to $X (excluding | Provided in my [specify periods at
already done [date2] GST) IRN sent to which propose to
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For Period Amount Rates to apply When it will be drawn
creditors on [IRN | withdraw funds to pay
date] remuneration. eg.

Immediately, when
funds are available or
at the end of the
[administration type]]

Future work to | [date2] to $X (excluding | [if remuneration [specify periods at

meeting date [meeting GST) is time based, which propose to

date] specify the hourly | withdraw funds to pay
rates that will be | remuneration. eg.
applied and any | Immediately, when
uplift to be funds are available or
applied in the at the end of the
future] [administration type]]

Voluntary $

Administration

total

Future work [meeting $X (excluding | [if remuneration [specify periods at

from meeting to | date] to GST) is time based, which propose to

execution of execution of specify the hourly | withdraw funds to pay

DOCA DOCA rates that will be | remuneration. eg.

Future work - Execution of | $X (excluding | applied and any | Immediately, when

DOCA DOCA to GST) uplift to be funds are available or

finalisation of applied in the at the end of the
DOCA future] [administration type]]

DOCA total $

Future work — [meeting $X (excluding | [if remuneration [specify periods at

Liquidation date] to GST) is time based, which propose to

finalisation of specify the hourly | withdraw funds to pay

liquidation rates that will be | remuneration. eg.
applied and any | Immediately, when
uplift to be funds are available or
applied in the at the end of the
future] [administration type]]

Liquidation $

total

Notes (delete before finalising report):

1. Only need to provide schedule of rates if time based and rates have changed from what has

previously been provided to creditors (for example in the IRN).
2. The totals of the three components in the VA table should match with the totals in the
summary at section 1.

Details of the [work already done OR future work that | intend to do OR work already done and
future work that | intend to do] are included at Schedule A.

Only if remuneration is on a time basis - Schedule B includes a breakdown of time spent by staff

members on each major task for work | have already done.

Actual resolutions to be put to the meeting are included at Schedule C for your information.

These resolutions also appear in the [proxy form for the meeting/proposal form] provided to you.
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4. Disbursements sought [only include if approval of disbursements are sought]

I am not required to seek creditor approval for costs paid to third parties or where | am recovering

a cost incurred on behalf of the administration, but | must provide details to creditors. Details of
these amounts are included in the attached Receipts and Payments (Refer Part 9 below).

Note: If the receipts and payments do not clearly show payments to third parties or payments to
the appointee as reimbursement of a cost incurred on behalf of the administration — they will
need to be disclosed in a separate schedule and the information above changed.

I am required to obtain creditor’s consent for the payment of a disbursement where |, or a related

entity of myself, may directly or indirectly obtain a profit.

For more information about disbursements, please refer to the Initial Remuneration Notice sent
to you on [IRN date].

The disbursements | would like creditors to approve is as follows [amend as necessary]:

For Period Amount
Disbursements | have already incurred [date] to [date] $
Future disbursements [date] to [date or pointin | $

time eg. End of

administration]

TOTAL $[TOTAL]

Details of the disbursements incurred and future disbursements are included at Schedule D.
Actual resolutions to be put to the meeting are also included at Schedule D. These resolutions
also appear in the [proxy form for the meeting/proposal form] provided to you.

5. Previous remuneration approvals [only include if you have previously had remuneration

approved]

The following remuneration approvals have previously been provided by creditors [or by the
Court or by the Committee of Inspection or (for personal insolvency) by the Inspector-General in

Bankruptcy]:
Period For Approving Amount Amount paid
body [optional | Approved
if different
approving
bodies]
[date] to [date] | [Work already $ $
done OR Future
work]
[date] to [date] | [Work already $ $
done OR Future
work]
[date] to [date] | [Work already $ $
done OR Future
work]
TOTAL remuneration previously $
approved
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If there has been a prior administration that has transitioned to this administration, you should
include details of the remuneration of the prior administration. You can either incorporate it into
the above table with a subtotal for each administration, or include a separate table.

| am now seeking approval of a further $X in remuneration which will bring total remuneration
claimed in this [appointment type] to $X.

Only include if remuneration has previously been approved prospectively: A full explanation is at
Schedule [X].

6. Likely impact on dividends

[Explain the likely impact of the remuneration claim on the dividend (if any) to creditors. It is a
statutory requirement to provide this information for all external administrations.

It is suggested that the report discuss:

e the general priorities in an administration / liquidation

o that any dividend will ultimately be impacted by the realisations achieved by the appointee
and the value of creditor claims admitted to participate in the dividend and

o that the fees for the work performed to achieve realisations has priority.

e comment on the uncertainty.

Suggested wording:

The Corporations Act sets the order for payment of claims against the company and it
provides for remuneration of the [Appointee Type] to be paid in priority to other claims. This
ensures that when there are sufficient funds, the [Appointee Type] receives payment for the
work done to recover assets, investigate the company’s affairs, report to creditors and ASIC
and distribute any available funds. Even if creditors approve my remuneration, this does not
guarantee that | will be paid, as | am only paid if sufficient assets are recovered.

Any dividend to creditors will also be impacted by the amount of assets that | am able to
recover and the amount of creditor claims that are admitted to participate in any dividend,
including any claims by priority creditors such as employees.

There are not expected to be sufficient funds to pay a dividend to unsecured creditors. OR |
am unable to provide a dividend estimate of any certainty at this stage of the [Appointment
Type]. If | do declare a dividend, any creditor whose claim has not yet been admitted will be
contacted and asked to submit a proof of debt.

OR

The Corporations Act sets the order for payment of claims against the company and it
provides for remuneration of the [Appointee Type] to be paid in priority to other claims. This
ensures that when there are sufficient funds, the [Appointee Type] receives payment for the
work done to recover assets, investigate the company’s affairs, report to creditors and ASIC
and distribute any available funds.

Based on:

e realisations to date,
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e estimated future realisations,

e my estimated remuneration to complete the [Appointment Type] and

e the estimated total of creditor claims based on the company’s records and claims lodged
now,

| estimate that a dividend of between [X] and [X] cents in the dollar will be paid in the
[Appointment Type]. However, this is subject to a range of variables, particularly the future
realisations and creditor claims.]

7. Funding received for remuneration and disbursements

If you have not received any funding from external sources — you do not need to include this
section of the report.

Any funding obtained from external sources, such as up-front payments, indemnities, litigation
funding, creditor funding, Assetless Administration Fund (AAF), Fair Entitlement Guarantee
(FEG) funding etc, details of that funding should be provided in this section of the report.

Remuneration that is going to be paid from external sources (other than payments under the
FEG or the AAF) must still be disclosed and approved in the usual way prior to the funding being
applied to pay remuneration. This section of the report is about disclosure of the funding
received.

8. Report on Progress of the Administration

While not strictly part of the Remuneration request, it is important that Members provide progress
reports to place the Remuneration claim in context.

It may well be that this information has already been incorporated into a general report to
creditors or the Voluntary Administrator’'s Report. If you include it in a separate report or letter,
you do not have to include it here. Rather the Remuneration Approval Report will be
supplemental to the main report.

9. Summary of Receipts and Payments

A summary of the receipts and payments for the [appointment type] as at [date] is at Schedule
[X] to this report.

If this report is being sent out after lodgement of an annual administration return (Form 5602),
include the following statement (IPS 70-5):

An annual administration return was lodged with ASIC on [date] which also provides information
on the conduct of the administration.

10. [ Personal insolvency only - Remuneration Claim Notice and review of remuneration
(include if applicable)

| advise that the regulated debtor and/or creditor may elect to receive a remuneration claim
notice (‘RCN’). The election must be made within 20 business days after receiving this report. |
ask that any such requests be made to [postal address or email address]. Creditors and/or the
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regulated debtor have 20 business days after receiving a RCN to request the Inspector-General
in Bankruptcy to review the remuneration claimed by me.]

11. Queries

If you have any queries in relation to the information in this report, please contact my staff on
[details].

You can also access information which may assist you on the following websites [delete ASIC or
AFSA as applicable]:

e ARITA at www.arita.com.au/creditors
o [ASIC at www.asic.gov.au (search for INFO 85).
e AFSA at www.afsa.gov.au (search for “remuneration information sheet”.]

Further supporting documentation for my remuneration claim can be provided to creditors on
request.

Attachments:

Schedule A — Details of work

Schedule B — Time spent by staff on each major task

Schedule C — Resolutions

Schedule D - Disbursements

Schedule [X] - Explanation where remuneration previously approved

Schedule [X] — Summary of receipts and payments
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Schedule A - Details of work

Example formats are provided for voluntary administrations (assumes 5 resolutions to cover the period from appointment to end of liquidation — edit as

required), an appointment with a prospective and retrospective resolution and an appointment with one resolution. Use the example format
appropriate for your appointment type — choose only one of the example formats. Example tasks for each task area is included at the end of this
section — insert appropriate tasks for the administration into the table.

Where you are accounting for remuneration on a time basis and claiming retrospective and prospective remuneration, you need to include separate
listings of tasks. With the new format, they are provide in the same table, but there is a separate column of tasks for each resolution.

Task listings must be provided notwithstanding the method of setting remuneration used. Where a basis other than time is used, it will not be
necessar